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Affidavit of Rafael Zahralddin-Aravena
Sworn September 13, 2016

173




Court File No: CV-16-11257-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
(COMMERCIAL LIST)

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES” CREDITORS ARRANGEMETN ACT,
R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT
OF PT HOLDCO, INC., PRIMUS TELECOUMMUNICATIONS CANADA INC.,
PTUS, INC., PRIMUS TELECOMMUNICATIONS, INC., AND LINGO, INC.

{Applicants)

AFFIDAVIT OF RAFAEL X. ZAHRALDDIN-ARAVENA
(Sworn September 13, 2016)

I, RAFAEL X. ZAHRATDDIN-ARAVENA, ESQ. of the City of Wilmington, in
the State of Delaware, MAKE OATH AND SAY:

1. I am an Director and Shareholder at the law firm of Elliott Greenleaf, P.C.
(“Eliott Greenleaf”), and as such have knowledge of the matters to which I hereinafter depose.

2. Pursuant to the Initial Order of the Honourable Mr. Justice Permy dated
January 19, 2016 (the “Initial Order”), FTI Consulting Canada Inc. was appointed pursuant to
the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act (Canada) as the Monitor of the Applicants in the
within proceedings (the “Monitor™).

3. Pursuant to the Initial Order, the Monitor selected Elliott Greenleaf as its counsel
in the State of Delaware in connection with the Monitor’s role as foreign representative of the
Applicants in the proceedings commenced pursuant to Chapter 15 of the U.S. Bankruptcy Code.
The Initial Order further provides that counsel to the Monitor shall be paid its reasonable fees

and disbursements at its standard rates and charges, whether incurred prior to or subsequent to
the date of the Initial Order.

22981298.1
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4. Elliott Greenleaf’s fees and disbursements for the period ended August 31, 2016~
are summarized in the invoices rendered to the Monitor (the “Invoices™). The Invoices are a fair_if::
and accurate description of the services provided, the disbursements incurred and the amounts ™"
charged by Elliott Greenleaf. The Invoices contain information and advice over which lawyer .
and client privilege is asserted, and for which privilege is not waived. As a result, redacted .
copies of the Invoices are attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “A”. Copies of the complete -

Invoices have been provided to the Monitor and I am advised by the Monitor that it has reviewed -

the Tnvoices and that it considers the fees and disbursements fair and reasonable.

5. Attached hereto and marked as Exhibit “B” is a summary of the lawyers Whose? |
services are refiected on the Invoices, including year of call, hourly rate and the total fees and. |

hours billed. Elliott Greenleaf expended a total of 685.7 hours, at an average houtly rate of USD” ‘

$398, in connection with this matter for the period ending August 31, 2016.

6. The total amount being claimed for the work performed by Elliott Greenleaf for ‘:
the period ending August 31, 2016 is USD $283,033.59, including USD $273,212.00 for fees, :

USD $9,821.59 for disbursements and USD $0.00 for taxes.

7. Elliot Greenleaf’s rates and disbursements are consistent with those in the market.;":

and in most instances below market for these types of matters in the state of Delaware.

8. This affidavit is sworn in support of the Monitor’s motion for, among other:

things, approval of the fees and disbursements of its legal counsel and for no other purpose.

SWORN BEFORE ME at the
| City of Wilmington, this 13™
day of September, 2016

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, ete. Rafaﬁ‘X. Zgﬁralddin-Aravena, Esquire
SANDRA ISABEL ROBERTS
NOTARY PUBLIC

STATE OF DELAWARE
My Commission Expires 02/25/2017

M e gt gt g’
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THIS IS EXHIBIT “A” TO
THE AFFIDAVIT OF RAFAEL X. ZAHRALDDIN-ARAVENA

SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 13" DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2016

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits
(or as may be)

SANDRA ISABEL ROBERTS
NOTARY PUBLIC

STATE OF DELAWARE
My Commission Expiras 02/26/2017

176 |




177

’Elliott Greenleaf |

www.,elliottgreenleaf.com 1105 Norih Market Streer, Suite 1700
A Professional Corporation Wilmington, Delaware 19801
Phone: (302) 384-9400 » Fax: (302) 384-9399

December 16, 2015

VIA ELECTRONIC AND FIRST CLASS MAIL
Atin: Nigel Meakin

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O.Box 104 .

Toronto, ON M5K 1G8, Canada

nigel. meakin@fticonsulting.com

Re:  Primus Telecommunications Canada lne., Primuas
Telecommunieations, Inc., and Lingo, Ine.
Our File No. 60612-001
Invoice Ne.: 132138

Dear Mr. Meakin:

Enclosed are our statements for legal services rendered in the above-referenced matter
" through November 30, 2015 in the amount of $15,127.50.

Payment can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed

below: .
CHECK: WIRE:
Ellictt Greenleaf, PC. Royal Bank America
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, 732 Montgomery Ave.
P.O. Box 3010, Narberth, PA 19072
Blue Bell, PA 19422-1956. ABA# 031 901 097

Elliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowski, P.C.
Acct, # 1000689950

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to comtact
me at (302) 384-9401 or at rxza(@elliottgreenieaf.com.

Sincerely,

Rafael X. Zahralddin

RXZA:; ach

Enclosure

cc:  Debbie Dougherty
Patricia Rooney

WILMINGTON BLUE BELL PHITADELPHIA SCRANTON WILXES-BARRE




l[ Elliott Greenleaf “

www.clliottgrecnleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
' P.0. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN#23-2617189

Attn: Nigel Meakin
FTI Consulting Canada, {nc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

78 Wellington St., Suite 2010
P.C. Bux 104
Toronto Ontaric MBK 1GB

December 18, 2015
Bill Number 132128
File Number 80812-001

CANADA

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re; Primus Telecommunications Canada ine., Primus Telecomrmunicatians,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through Nowvember 30, 2015

11/09M15

1110415
11111115

11112115

11112115
1112115
11412115
1112/15
11112115
11112015

111315

“114/13/15

SIC

SiC
RXZ

Ale

RXZ
RXZ
SIC
SIC
Sle
SAK

RXZ

SAK

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding preparation of recard regarding flrst
day motions and procedures in chapter 15 proceedings in regards to sale of
assels; prepare record and checklist of same

Finalize research for R. Zahralddin regarding chapter 15 first day procedures

Analyze praposed first day affidavit (.3) call with M, Kenyukhova (.5)
instryctions to S. Kinsella on research on

- - |
Communication re; retention letter and confererce call with R. Zahralddin, S.
Kinsella and Primus (.1); circulate re: same (1)
Analyze Transition Services Agresment farwarded by M. Konyukhova
Update research file re: Delaware and SDNY Chapter 155

Circulate contact information to M. Konyukhova

. Preparation of record regarding documents from M. Konyukhova

Update record regarding bid and APA deadlines
Instructions fram R. Zahralddin (.4); review N
(4.0}

Call with clients and Canadian Gounsel re: NRG_gGzG————————
related follow up

Review research forwarded by R. Zahralddin re; NN

Page 1

350 Hrs

0.70 Hrs
1.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.50 Hrs
0.30 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
¢.30 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
4.40 Hrs

1.20 Hrs

3.60 Hrs




FTl Consulting Canada, [ne.

111315  SAK Telephone conference with Canadian counsel re INEENNNN 2nd  0.70 Hrs
conference with R, Zahralddin re same
111615 SIC Preparation of record regarding documnents from client and correspondence  0.60 Hrs
per S. Kinsella instruction
11175 SAK Begin preparing memo re: Delawate Bankruptcy Gourt Ch. 15 proceedings 3,30 Hrs
1119115 RXZ Calt with regulatory counsel from Akin Gump 0.20 Hrs
11119M5  SAK Continue drafting Chapter 15 proceedings memorandum and begin drafting  4.7G Hrs
verified petition
11/20115 AJB Prepare record for and circulate chapter 15 documentation for R. Zahralddin -~ 0.30 Hrs
and S, Kinsella
1120115 SAK Draft multiple pleadings for Ch. 15 filing: Corporate Ownership Statement; 8.30 Hrs
Motion for Joint Administration of Chapter 15 cases; Moticn for Hearing on
Verified Petiion; Emergency Temporary Restraining Order Request and
Mofice of Hearing re Sale
11/2415 SAK  Communications with Canadian counsel and IP counsel re I 0.20 Hrs
11/25(15  SIC Correspondence with S. Kinsella regarding preparation of record; prepare 0.30 Hrs
same
11/25/15 SAK  Communications with Canadian counsel re IR communications with ~ 0.20 Hrs
R. Zahralddin re same :
11/25M18 SAK Instructions to S. Roberts re document preparations and organization issues  0.40 Hrs
11730115 AJB Prepare and revise retention letter as advised by client (NO CHARGE) 0.40 Hrs
11/30MS KHH Edits to draft retention letier per client's request and send same to clientfor  0.30 Hrs
review and signature (NO CHARGE)
TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES
LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY
Brown, Ashley J. ‘ 0.40 Hrs 0 /hr $0.00
Harmon, Kathryn Hodges 0.30 Hrs 0 fhr $0.00
Brown, Ashley J. 0.50 Hrs 200 /hr $100.00
Roberts, Sandra | .70 Hrs 225 jhr $1,282.50
KINSELLA, SHELLEY A 25.80 Hrs 450 thr $11,610.00
Zahraiddin-Aravena, Rafael X. - 3.50 Hrs 810/hr $2,135.00
36.20 Hrs $15,127.50

Page 2

179

$15,127.50




FTI Consulting Canada, Inc. 180

TOTAL THIS BILL T $15,127.50

GRAND TOTAL DUE $15,127,50

Amounts outstanding over 30 days are subject to 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected.

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at (215) 977-1014

Page 3




|Elli0tt Greenleaf l

www.clliottgreenleaf.com 1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700
Wilmington, Delaware 19801

Phone: (302) 384-9400 « Fax: (302) 384-9399

A Professional Corporation

January 4, 2016

VIA ELECTRONIC AND FIRST CLASS MATI,
Attn: Nigel Meakin

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O.Box 104

Toronto, ON M5K 1G8, Canada

nigel. meakin@fticonsulting.com

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc,, Primus
Telecommunications, Inc., and Lingo, Inc.
Qur File No. 60612-001
Invoice No.: 132204

Dear Nigel:

Enclosed are our statements for legal services rendered in the above-referenced matter
through January 4, 2015 in the amount of $59,362.50. Additionally, there is an ontstanding
balance of $15,127.50 for a total amount due at present of $74,490.00.

Payment can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed

below:
CHECK: WIRE:;
Elliott Greenleaf, PC. Royal Bank America
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, 732 Montgomery Ave.
P.O. Box 3010, Narberth, PA 19072
Blue Beli, PA 19422-1956. ABA# 031 901 097

Elliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowski, P.C.
Acct. # 1000689990

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to contact
me at (302) 384-9401 or at rxza@ellictigreenleal.com,

RXZA: ach

Enclosure (2)

cc:  Debbie Dougherty
Patricia Rooney

WILMINGTON BLUE BELL PHILADELEPHIA SCRANTON WILKES-BARRE
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| Elliott Greenleaf

www.elliottgreenleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREEMLEAF
P.O. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189
Attn: Nigel Meakin January 4, 2018
FTI Consulting Canada, Inc. Bill Nurmber 132204
TD Waterhcuse Tower _
79 Wellington St., Suite 2010 File Nurmber 60612-001
F.Q. Box 104
Toronto Ontario MSK 1G8
CANADA,

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Primus Telecommunications Ganada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through January 31, 2016

12/01/15 RXZ  Research re: pEEEEEGEE—_— 2.2}, follow up with S5,
Kinsella (3); analyze APA (2.0}

1200215  AJB Prepare record for Thane International hearing.

12/0211§ EMS  Office conference and assignments from R. Zahralddin re: asset purchase
agreement, sale, and chapter 15 bankruptcy

12102115 JXS  Analyze IR meeting with R. Zahralddin re: same

12/02(15  JXS  Meeting with R. Zahralddin re; nuihies s —

12/02/15  JXS . Begin analysis of I =21 to K. Harmon
re: same

12/02/15 KHH  Conference with R, Zahralddin and J, Stemermman regarding memo
requested by client pertaining to
PR s el s
: ; S e varrr: .
12102115 RXZ Analyze APA, related review of record, research, analysis and comments to
same

1202115 SIC Instruction from R. Zahralddin regarding APA research (.2); research
regarding same {1.1); circulate to R. Zahralddin for review and reference (1)

12/02/15 SAK  Conference with R. Zahralddin re T NGNS
12/02M15 SAK  Communications with R. Zabralddin re employee issues
12/03115 EMS  Analyze retention issues (2.5); and draft email re: same (.2)

Page 1

4.50 Hrs

D10 Hrs
0.50 Hrs

0.80 Hrs
(.30 Hrs
0.50 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

6.50 Hrs

1.40 Hrs

020 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
2.70 Hrs

182




FTI CGonsulting Canada, Inc.

1210315
12/03115

12/03/15

12/63/15

12/0315
12/03/15

12/04/15

12/04/15
12/04/15

12/04/15
12/04/15

12/04115

12104115

12104715

12104115
12/04/15
12/07/15

1210716
1210715
12/7115

12/07/15

EMS

JXS

KHH

KHH

SiC

SAK

AJB

EMS
EMS

EMS
JX3

KHH

KHH

RXZ

RXZ
SAK
AJB

EMS
EMS
KHH

KHH

Analyze [ TNNGEEEEEEE (3.5); 2nd begin drafting memo re:

same (.5)

Meeting with R, Zahralddin and K. Harman re: INEEEEEESERNN—_—
N, (- same; email to K. Harmon re: same

Research issues refating to G
N as well as sane I

Analysis of

Instructions from E. Sutty regarding preparation of email {.1); preparation of
email regarding retention of professlonals in a chapter 15 (.5)

Conference and instructions te E. Sutty re S r<view research re
same

Communication with R, Zahralddin re: contact list for counsel {.2); prepare
record re: same (2.0); circulate to M. Konyukhova, K. Harmon, R.
Zahralddin, E. Sutty and S. Kinsella (.1); communication with M.
Konyukhova re; listing of debtor representative {.1)

Calls with R. Zahralddin re: IR

Analyze il (3.0}, calls with L. Rodgers re: e {.2); revise
retention agreement (.6)

Analyze I

Meefing with R. Zahralddin and K. Harmon re: I
. cmails to K. Harmon re: same

Analysis of standards applicable to issues relating to |G

Draft Executive Summary for client related to S
relating {o [N

Discuss preference and disqualification issues with E. Sutty {.2); emails to
and from counsel for the rmonitor re: same {.2)

Analyze memo re; NG
Analyze research forwarded by M. Gregory re chapter 15 issues

. Prepare record for Primus Telecommunications/Benefit Plans conference

call

Analyze \ I

Analyze status email from R. Zahralddin

Complete analysis of I

Complete Executive Summary for client addressing NN =nd

Page 2

£ 00 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

3.90 Hrs

1.70 Hrs

0.680 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

240 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
3.80Hrs

1.80 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

1.10 Hrs

2.70 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs
0.50 Hrs
0.20 Hrs

250 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
210 Hrs

1.40 Hrs
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FTI Consulting Ganada, Inc.

12/07/15

1210715

12/08/15
12/08/15
12/08{15
12/08/15

12/0815
12/08/15

12/08/15

12/09/15
12/089/15
12/09/15
1210815
1240915

12/09/15

12/08/15
12/09/15
12/10/15
1210113

12M10/15
1210415

1211018
12/10/18
12/10/15

1210715
12110115
12110115
1210118

12111115

SIC

SAK

EMS
EMS
HFS
KHH

RXZ

RXZ

EMS
EMS
EMS
HFS
XS

KHH

RXZ

EMS
EMS

EMS
HFS

JAS
JXS
KHH

RXZ
RXZ
SIC
siC

KHH

Instruction from R. Zahralddin regarding chapter 15 agenda research;
research regarding same; circulate to R, Zahralddin for review and reference

Communications with counsel re chapter 15 first day check list; conference
with R. Zahralddin re sarne

Emails with L. Rodgers re: retention agreement -
Analyze benefit and 401(k) summaries

Analyze Employee Benefit Material; call with R. Zahralddin
Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding analysis of i

Analyze US benefit materials forwarded by M, Cameron and reply

Analyze worker's compensation materials forwarded by client and M.
Gameron (.4); instructions to J. Stemerman (.2}

Analyze emails, related documents, from Stikeman re: benefit plans (.5);
emails to H, Seidzikowski re: same {.1)

Gall and office conference with R. Zahralddin re; Ml and memo
Draft memo re: | requested by M. Cameron

Analyze additional research provided by R. Zahralddin re: IR
Draft e-mail outline of S, c2! with R. Zahralddin

Emails from/te R. Zahralddin re: RN =nalyze Primus
workers comp documents

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding INRIISNNEEE. <
implications thereof on Primus’ United States based employees

Analyze responses re: benefit plang from M. Cameron
Analyze US employee materials forwarded by M. Cameron and reply
Finaiize WSS -s requested by M. Cameren

Conference call with R. Zahralddin, H. Siedzikowski, client and Ganadian
counse! re: I —

Analyze el
Conference call with R. Zahraiddin and Capadian counsel regarding

Meeting with R. Zahralddin re:
Continue analysis of I

Research

Finalize employee analysis
Call with Menitor and co-counsel (.8); related follow up with paralegals (.2)
Update employee executive summary memo; circulate same

Instruction fram R. Zahralddin regarding affidavits; follow up conference with
R. Zahralddin; circulate to client

Revislons to Executive Summary regarding _1

for sending to client

Page 3

0.30 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

£.20 Hrs
0.50 Hrs
2.20 Hrs
0.50 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.60 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
4.80 Hrs
1.30 Hrs
1.10 Hrs
1.10 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.30 Hrs
0.80 Hrs
0.90 Hrs

0.90 Hrs
0.90 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
1.30 Hrs
4.50 Hrs

0.70 Hrs
1.00 Hrs
0.80 Hrs
0.60 Hrs

1.00Hrs
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FTI Consuiting Canada, Inc.

12114115

12/14/15

12114115
1211415

1211515

121E/15

12116115
12/16/15

1218/15
12116/15

12116115

1216115

121715

121715
121915
1212115

12121115
1212115

1212115

1224115

1212215
12122015
1222115

12023115
12/23115
12123015

KHH

KHH

SIC
SAK

EMS

SIC

EMS
EMS

EMS
KHH

KHH

RXZ

EMS

sic
EMS
EMS

JXS
SIC

SAK

SAK

JXS

SAK

SAK

EMS
EMS
HFS

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding information to incorporats info
Executive Surmmary going to client relating to

Edits to Executive Summary regarding R 2nd preparation for
sending to client _

Email to aftorneys regarding upcoming APA deadline

Analyze and update IENEG_———NNN =nd provide comments fo R.
Zahralddin and K. Harmon

Analyze and supplernent revised asset purchase agreement as reguested by
M. Cameron

Preparation of record regarding APA, ERISA and privacy issues for E. Sutfy
circulate same

Additional edits to asset purchase agreement as requested by M. Cameron

Office confersnce with R. Zahralddin re: APA comments (.2} and cail with
M. Cameran re: same {.3)

Office conference with R, Zahralddin and K. Harman re: [N
Final revisions to Executive Summary regarding /GG——

Email to M. Gameron, M. Meakin and M. Konyukhova with Executive
~Summary regarding

Analyze APA {.8); and related notes and comments to E. Sutty (.5); follow up
with Stikeman (.4)

Research and analyze employee benefit issues for asset purchase
agreement (2.5); and edit accordingly (1.5)

Circulate updated APA to E. Sutty for review
Email current draft of assef purchase agreements to co-counsel

Analyze I ="' S pplement
draft asset purchase agreement, and circulate for comment

Continue M, <rd APA

f
Research regarding
Il per S. Kinsella instruction; preparation of record of same

Analyze multipie documents forwarded by 8. Roberts per R. Zahralddin
instructions regarding chapter 15 first days

Communications to M. Konyukhaova re first day pleadings; forward several
pleading drafts; comments fram R. Zahralddin re same

Meeting with S. Kinsella re: procedural issues; analyze same
Continue preparing pleadings

Research re [ CCr7murications with

R. Zahralddin re same

Call with H. Siedzikowski re: status of comments to APA

Analyze R. Zahralddin comments to APA

Analyze Asset Purchase Agreement changes for IR
Page 4

0.20 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
120 Hrs

240Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.50 Hrs
0.50 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
G.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

1.70 Hrs

4.00 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
4 80 Hrs

1.30 Hrs
0.80 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.60 Hrs
6.40 Hrs
1860 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.B0 Hrs
0.60 Hrs
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FTi Consulting Canada, Inc.

12{23M5 JXS Meeting with S. Kinsella re: procedural issues 0.20 Hrs
12/23M15 MCG  Prepare factual background for verified pefition 0.80 Hrs
12/23/15 RXZ  Analyze and update verified pelition draft 1.20 Hrs
12/23M15 SAK Continue preparing pleadings 5,80 Hrs
12/23115 SAK  Review communications from M. Konyukhova re US and Canadian 0.10 Hrs
employees
12/23/15 SAK Review Primus wrifeup prepared by M. Gregory for declaration preparation 0.20 Hrs
12/23/15 SAK Communications with R. Zahraiddin re |GGG <vicw 0.60 Hrs
research re same
12/23M15 SAK Analyze Initial Order affidavit and prepare fo revise pleadings accordingly 0.80 Hrs
12/24/15 SAK Communications with R. Zahralddin re PUC and FCC authorizations 0.20 Hrs
12{24/15 SAK Supplement pleadings with information for fnitial Order; continue revising 6.20 Hrs
©° pleadings
12/28/15 KHH  Analysis of 1.60 Hrs
12/28/15 RXZ Updates from S. Kinsella re: motion for recognition (.5); follow up on motion .60 Hrs
to limit notice issues with K. Harmon {.4); analyze research from K. Harmon
re: recent motions to limit notice {.2)
12/29/16 RXZ  Analyze APA update 0.80 Hrs
12/20/15 RXZ  Call with Monitor and counsel re: update on filing 0.40Q Hrs
1228115  SIC Conference with R. Zahralddin and S. Kinsefla regarding filing preparation 0.60 Hrs
{.3Y): research regarding updated chapter 15 petition form (new form 401}
{.2); circulate to S. Kinsella for preparation (.1)
12/29115 SAK  Conference with R. Zahralddin re revised APA and pleading revisicns 0.40 Hrs
12/29115 SAK  Communications with R. Zahralddin re Sy 040 Hrs
12/29/15 SAK Analyze revised APA 0.40 Hrs
12/30/15  SIC instruction from S. Kinsella regarding preparation of orders to first day 3.30 Hrs
pleadings (,1); preparation of same (3.2}
12/30M5 SAK instructions to S. Roberts re preparations of multiple orders 0.40 Hrs
12130115 SAK Communications with R. Zahralddin re automatic stay and related relief, 0,50 Hrs
_ review research re
01/031168 RXZ Finalize and update drafis prepared by S. Kinselia and forward o project 5.00 Hrs
team and monitor
TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES
LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY
Brown, Ashley J. 2.70 Hrs 200 fhr $540.00
Gregory, Mark G. 0.80 Hrs 225 /hr $180.00
Roberts, Sandra | 9.40 Hrs 225 fhr $2,115.00
Harmmon, Kathryn Hodges 19.10 Hrs 300 thr $5,730.00
STEMERMAN, JONATHAN M, 8.70 Hrs 375/hr ’ $2,512.50
KINSELLA, SHELLEY A. 2B.60 Hrs 450 hr $12,870.00

Page 5

$59,362.50




FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.
SUTTY, ERIC M.

SIEDZIKOWSKI, HENRY F.
Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X.

PREVIOUS BILLS OUTSTANDING
132138 12/16M15

39,10 Hrs
§.10 Hrs
25.20 Hrs

138.70 Hrs

15,127.50

$15,127.50

450 /hr $17,5685.00
480 /hr $2,448.00
810 /hr $15,372.00
$59,362.50
TOTAL THIS BILL
GRAND TOTAL DUE

Amounts outstanding over 30 days are subject to 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected.

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at {215) 977-1014

Page 6
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[Elliott Greenleaf ,

www.clliottgreenicafcom 1105 North Market Sireet, Suite 1700
A Professional Corporation Wilmington, Delaware 12801

Phone: (302) 3849400 « Fax: (302) 384-935%
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February 10, 2016

VIA ELECTRONIC AND FIRST CLASS MAIL
Attn: Nigel Meakin

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O. Box 104 ) ‘

Toronto, ON MSK. 1G8, Canada
nigel.meakin@fticonsulting.com
steven.bissell@fticonsulting.com

Re:  Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc.
Our File No. 66612-001
Ipvoice No.: 132904

Dear Nigel:

Enclosed is our statement for legal services rendered in the above-referenced matter through
January 31, 2016 in the amount of $106,217.75. Thark you for your recent payment of $74,490.00,
We are generally tracking the budget with the additional expense of the preparation of the opinion
letter and US security searches requested after the budget had been finalized.

Payment can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed below:

CHECK: WIRE:

Elliott Greenleaf, PC. Royal Bank America
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, 732 Montgomery Ave.
P.O. Box 3010, Narberth, PA 19072
Blue Bell, PA 19422-1956. ABA# 031 901 097

Elliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowsli, P.C.
Acct. # 1000689990

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(302) 384-9401 or at rxza{@elliottgreenleaf.com. '

Sincerely,

afael X. Zahralddin

RXZA: acb

Enclosure

cc:  Debbie Dougherty
Patricia Rooney
Steven Bissell
Linc Rogers

WILMINGTON BLUE BELL PHILADELFHIA SCERANTON WILEES-BARRE




Ililliott Greenleaf f'

www.elliottgreenleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.O. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189
Attn: Nigel Meakin February 10, 2016
FT1 Consulting Canada, inc. Bill Number 132904
TD Waterhouse Tower )
79 Wellington St., Suite 2010 File Number 60612-001
P.Q. Box 104
Toronto Ontaric MSK 1G8
CAMNADA

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through January 31, 2016

12/02/18 HFS Call with R. Zahralddin regafding I - Asset Purchase 1.50 Hrs

Agreement; follow-up e-mail, analyze docurment
12/03/15 HFS . Analyze Asset Purchase Agreement with R, Zahralddin comments 2.10 Hrs
01/02/16  SAK Supplement mulfiple orders prepared by S. Roberts 1.20 Hrs
01/04/16  KHH Review edits ta draft documents to be filed implementing Chapter 15 0.30 Hrs

proceedings to ensure accuracy

010416 RXZ Prepare preliminary project management plan for filings (.4); finalize varicus 120 Hrs
orders and forward drafts to client and co-counsel (.B}

01/04M8 RXZ Email inquiry on UGG lien searches{.1); analyze UGG and related firm 1.2Q Hrs
resources(.5); and respond with summary memo and recommendation via

email on information on IR (-C)

01/0416 SIC Analyze emails from R. Zahralddin regarding instructions fo update motians ~ 0.10 Hrs
and arders

01/04168  SIC Instructions from S. Kinsella regarding preparation of temporary restraining 1.20 Hrs
arder motions and orders; preparation of same

01/04/16  3IC Instrugtions frem R. Zahralddin regarding preparation of edits to temporary 0.10 Hrs
resfraining order motions and arders; preparation of same

01/04/16 SIC Instruction from R. Zahraiddin regarding edits {o agenda; preparation of 0.20 Hrs
same

01/o4/18  SIC Preparation of edits to orders granting temporary restrainingi order per S, 0.60Hrs
Kinsella edits

01104716 SAK  Review I ith R. Zahralddin and communications re same .30 Hrs
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FT1 Consulting Canada, Inc.

01/04/16
01/04/16

01/05/16
01/05/16
01/05/18
01/05/16

01/05/16

01/05/16

01/05/16

01105416

01/05/16
01/05/16

g1f05H1&
01105416

01/06/16

01/06/16
01/06M16
01/06/16
01/06/16

01/08/16
01/06/16

01/08/16
01/06/16
01/06/16
01/08M186
01/07416

SAK
SAK

EMS
JXS
KHH
MCG

RXZ

RXZ

RXZ

SlC

sIC
SAK

SAK
SAK

ACB

EMS
JXS
JXS
MCG

SiC
SAK

SAK
SAK
SAK
SAK
EMS

Revise TRO orders {temporary and altemative interim, and provisional)

Instructions to S. Roberis re revisions to orders; communications with R.
Zahralddin re same

Coordination meeting regarding upcoming deadlines
Meeting with R. Zahralddin, S. Kinsella and E. Sutty re: Il
Coordination meeting regarding upcoming deadlines with staff

Teleconference with R. Zzhralddin r= IR
M (.2); analyze parameters of I (.5), prepare for

teleconference with Canadian attorneys (.4); research/analyze case law and
statutes re NN (1.C)

Emails and update from A, Shalviri (.3); analyze comments i recognition
documents and forward updates and instructions fe S. Kinsella (1.2)

Emails and request from L. Komis to conduct US intellectual proparty
searches (.3); follow up with M. Gregory(.3); plan scope of searches(.5}; and
related research on NN (.2} instructions to M.
Gregory re; same (.2)

Emails from S. Bissell re: forecasi, prepare budget and estimates re; same
and reply

Instructions from S. Kinseila regarding preparation of checklist; prepare
checklist for first day pleadings; circulate to R. Zahralddin and S. Kinselta for
review and comment :

Assist S. Kinsella regarding preparation of pefition

Instryctions to S. Roberts re preparation of first day filing check list;
telephone conference with R. Zahralddin re same

Continue drafting Declaration

Review cormments from A. Shilvari re draft pleadings and instructions from
R. Zahralddin re same

Instructions from E. Sutty re opinion letter (. 1); preparation of record re same
(4.0}

Analyze security agreements and UCC filings
Meeting with S. Kinsella re: procedural issues
Analyze procedural Issues; emait to S. Kinsella re: same

Teleconference with attorneys at Blakes Cassel in Toronto, discuss

Instructions from S. Kinsella regarding preparation of motions and orders
{.1); preparation of same (.3)

Conference with J, Stememman re "foreign representative” issue related to
Declaration issues and review research re same

Analyze Security memo

Communications with R. Zahralddin re APA issues
Analyze Initial Order |atest drait

Continue drafting Declaration

Analyze and prepare record for opinion letter including US PTO search
results, discugsions and instructions to M. Gregory re: same, analyze
caselaw re: same

Page 2

1.50 Hrs
(.30 Hrs

(.40 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
2.70 Hrs

1,50 Hrs

1.60 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

(1.90 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

2.10Hrs
0.20 Hrs

4,10 Hrs

5.30 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
0.70 Hrs
5.20 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

130Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.30 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
1.70 Hrs
4.50 Hrs
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FT! Consulting Canada, Inc.

0110716
a1/07/18

Ql/g7He

010716

01/07116

0107418

g1/07/18

01/07186

01/07/16
81/08/16

01/0816

01/08/16

pi/0818

01/08/16

01/06/16

01/08/16

01/08/16

01/08/16

01/08M16
01/08118

01111118

EMS
KHH

KHH

MCG

RXZ

RXZ

RXZ

SIC

SAK
ACB

EMS

EMS
JX3

KHH
KHH

MCG

MCG

SIC

SIC
SAK

EMS

Drafi opinion lelter

Analysis of recent motion practice and Crders regarding same in other

chapter 15 proceedings related to I
: | - ,

e 2N
determination of whether there is any applicable caselaw regarding same in
any circuit in Unifed States

Conference with R. Zahralddin and S. Kinsella regarding ENRNG_————

Continue search of USPTO and US Copyright Office for all trademarks,
patents, and copyrights, inciuding applications therefore Comipile list of |P
Search assignment records for all [P Compile list of assignments and
securify interests. report to client.

Analyze results of USPTO searches(1); analyze UCG searches performed
by Canadian co-counsel (1.2); analyze format for opinion letter forwarded by
co-counsel {.2); various meetings, updates, and instructions to M. Gregory

~and E. Sutty (1.2)

Updates to memo for opinion letter team prepared by M. Gregory

Analyze motion fo shorten fime issues and instructions to K. Harmaon re-
same

Instructiens from 5. Kinsella regarding IS
research regarding same

Instructions fo 5. Roberts re_l

instructions fram E. Sutty re UCC documents (.1); preparation of record re
same (.2)

Draft opinion letter, analyzed [REEEGG_G——R, C: s with
|

A. Levine, analyze
Analyze additional USPTO search results

Emails toffrom R. Zahralddin re; | IR
B T L ——————————a—

Conference with E. Sutty and M. Gregory regarding SEENEEEENGGG_—_
|

Supplement US IP search - all IP owned by PT Holdco Report results to
client

Analyze i

re; I 1< cting with
E. Sutty re conflicting flens on US trademark registration

Instructions from E. Sutty regarding UCG search and merger documents
{.1}; research regarding same (.6); correspondence with Delaware Secretary
of State regarding same {.2); conference with R. Zahraiddin, E. Sutty and h.

Gregory regarding obtaining merger documents (.3); correspandence with
DES regarding same (.2); circulate document to E. Sutty for review (1)

Preparation of formatting edits ta opinion per E. Sutly instruction

Revisions to Declaration and communications with R. Zahralddin re siatus of
Debtors' drafi

Analyze PTQ security agreement and related documents
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5.50 Hrs
3.80 Hrs

0.3¢ Hrs

6.10 Hrs

3.40 Hrs

1.30 Hrs
0.50 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

10.50
Hrs

0.70 Hrs
2.10 Hrs
1.20 Hrs
0.20 Hrs

1.20 Hrs

1.90 Hrs

1.50 Hrs

0.30 Hrs
1,40 Hrs

4.30 Hrs
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

011116
o1/11H6

Q1/11/16
0111116

0111116
0112116
011216
01112116
01112118

011216
0111216
0113116

01113116
01H13M1e
0113116

01/14/186
01114116

01/14116
01114118

0171416

01/15/16
01/15/16

(1/15/16
01H16/16
Q11716

01/18/18
118116

EMS

MCG

SiC
SIC

SAK
EMS3
RXZ
sIC
SIC

SAK
SAK
SIiC

SIC
SAK
SAK

SIC
Sic

SAK
SAK

SAK

JXS
SiC

SAK
SAK
SAK

EMS
EMS

Analyze and supplement opinion letter based on new security
documentation

Continued IP searching, reconcile IP search results with UCC search resuits,
analyze 1P ownership with respect fo time of UCC filings

Preparation of blacklines fo opinion lefter per E. Sutty instruction

. Instruction from S. Kinsella regarding research (.1); preparation of record of

Madison Niche chapter 15 first day motions for 8, Kinsella (.2)
Instl:ucfions to 5. Roberts re chapter 15 lﬁlings; review same
Analyze I - status

Analyze updated declaration

Preparation of petition per S. Kinsella instruction

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding memo to L, Rodgers regarding
- preparafion of record of supporting
documents; circulate to L. Rodgers for reference

Communications with Monitor re upcoming filing
Review revised Nowlan Affidavit and incorporate changes inte Declaration

Instruction from R. Zahralddin regarding preparation of first day pleading
chart, preparation of same; circulate to R. Zahralddin and S, Kinsella for
review

Preparation of ediis to first day motions and orders per S, Kinsella comiment
Communications with U.S. Trustee re upceming filing

Revisions to all First Day Pleadings and incorporate edits; communications
with A, Shilvari re same; insfructions o S. Roberts

Preparation of edits to first day motion chart per R. Zahralddin comment

Praparation of edits to first day motions and declarations per 8.Kinselta
comment

Telephone conference with Monitor's counsel

Review revised First Day pleadings prepared by S. Roberis, further
revisions, and circulate all

Communications with Monitor's counse! re IEEIEIEIEGNGGGGEGENGNE

Meeting with 8. Kinsella re: First Day affidavit

Preparation of edits to first day motions and verified petition per S.Klnsella
comment

Communications with US Trustee re temporary resfraining motion issues

Communications with Monitor's counse! re |

Communications from Monitor's counsel re NG
I cO'unications with R. Zahralddin re pleading check
list

Call with RXZA, SAK, KHH and SIR re: document preparation

Analyze and supplement petitions, verification, motion for joint
administration, corporate ownership statement, emergency motion for a
temporary restralning order, motion to schedule a hearing, and related
pieadings
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2.30 Hrs

2.60 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.50 Hrs
1.20 Hrs
0.30 Hrs
0.90 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
3.20 Hrs
0.90 Hrs

4,80 Hrs
(.20 Hrs
3.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
5,10 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
2.30 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

2.80 Hrs

. 0.40 Hrs

0.3¢ Hrs
0.40 Hrs

0.50 Hrs
3,40 Hrs

192




FT! Consulting Canada, Inc.

01/18/18

01/18/16
01/18/16
01/1816
Q1/18116
01nshe
01118416
01!18!16
01/18/16
01118416
0111816
0171816

01/18/16

. MABME

01/18f16

0111816

01/18/16
0118H6

0118116
01/18/16

Q1181186

0141816

01118116

01/18/16
0111916

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

. KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH
RXZ

SIG

SIC

SIC
SAK

SAK
SAK

SAK

SAK

SAK

SAK
AJB

Conference call with M. Meakin, A. Shalviri, L. Rogers, R. Zahralddin and 5.
Kinsella regarding tasks to be completed in advance of flling and edits to be
made to documents

Edits to Docurnents Ghecklist to be sent to client in advance of filing and
analysis of citations therein to ensure accuracy

Review and analysis of file and correspondence from client and co-counsel
for information relevant to making edits {o documents prepared for filing

Conference with R, Zahrakidin, S. Kinsella, E. Sutty and S. Roberts
reqarding edits to be made to documents in advance of filing

" Revisions to Meakin Declaration based upon comments and edits provided

by client and co-counsel

Revisions to Procedures Mation based upon edits and comments provided
by client and co-counsel

Revisions to Chapter 15 List based upon edits and comments provided by
chient and co-counsel :

Revisions to Corporate Ownership Statement based upon additional
information provided by co-counsel

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding edits to be made to documents to
be filed fo start proceeding and substantive issues related thereto

Redactions to draft doclUments to be sent to United States Trusiee per his
request in advance of filing

Emails to client with revised draft documents as well as with documents that
nead to be signed by N. Meakin

Emails with co-counsel requesting and regarding EINs for Delaware-based
corporations

Revisions to Form 401s with additional information provided by co-counsel

Calls, emaits, and related follow up and instructions on pleadings and
pefition to S. Roberts and K. Harmon

Varlous correspondence with R, Zahralddin and S. Kinsella regarding
preparation of filing, fees and related progedures; research regarding same

Conference call with R, Zahralddin, S. Kinsella, E. Suity and K. Harmon
regarding preparation of edits to first day motions and petitions

Preparation of edits to first day motions and petitions

Comimunications with S. Roberts and R. Zahialddin re filing fees; confirm
procedure for same

Revise Meakin Declaration and Petition; instructions to 1. Harmon re sams

Supplement first day filing check list and communications to R. Zahralddin
and 5. Roberts re same

Review Blake's comments to first day pleadings and communications with R.

Zahralddin, S. Roberts and K. Harman re same

Multiple teleconferences with Monitor's counsel and co-counsel re revisions
to first day pleadings and related issues

Instructions to staff re preperations and multiple exhibits needed for Meakin
Declaration, communications re same

Communications with E. Sutty re non-debtor entities

Research I

Page &

0.60 Hrs

2.40 Hrs

2.50 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

1.60 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.30 Hrs
1.20 Hrs

1,10 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

6.30 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

2.70 Hrs
0.90 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

1.10 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.20 Hrs

1983




FTl Consulting Canada, Inc.

01/19/16
01/19/16

011918
01/19/18

01119116
0119/18
01/19/16
01/19/18

0119116
01/19/16

01/19/18
0119418

01719416

(1/20/18
01720118
01/20/16
01/20M16
01/20/16
01/20/1&
01/20/16
01720115

01/20/16

01720118

01/20/16

EMS
KHH

KHH
KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH
MCG

sic

SAK

SAK

SAK

ACE
AJB

EMS
EMS
KHH
KHH
KHH
KHH

KHH

SIC

Attention fo various decuments and assignments fer filing

Revisions to Form 401s based upon updated information provided by
Monitor and Canadian counsel

Addition of parathentical cite in TRO Motion

Edits to various documents fo be filed as chapter 15 filing and prepare for
filing with Gourt

Revisions to Meakin Declaration based upen edits and comments provided
by Canadian counsel and ensure that it is consistent with Nowlan Affidavit

Revisions fo draft Verified Petition based upon comments and edits provided
by Canadian counse! and ensure that it is consistent with Nowlan Affidavit
and Meakin Declaration

Preparation of exhibits to all documents to be filed

Review first day pleadings checklist, review all pleadings with exhibits,
compile list of exhibits, prepare for filing

Calls to the Court re: scheduling (.5); calls to and from UST and related
follow up with S. Kinsella re: injunctive relief (1.2); calls to and from
Canadian counsel {.8); finalize documents and supervise filing (8.0}

Various correspondence and conferences with R. Zahralddin, 8. Kinsella
and K. Harmon regarding edits to first day pleadings; preparation of edits to
firsi day pleadings; fiing of same

Communications with US Trustee and R. Zahralddin re provisional relief
issues (.4); conference with R. Zahralddin re same (.4)

Communications with US Trustee re first day pleadings; communications
with R. Zahralddin and staff re same

Revise and finalize multiple first day pleadings and instructions te K. Harmon
and S. Roberts; multiple communications with Monitor's professionals re
same

Preparation of record re; first day hearing binders for court

Prepare record for first day hearing decuments for R. Zahralddin
Analyze and revise agenda and oversee filing of same

Analyze pleadings and related conferences with K. Harmon

Prepare hinders of First Day matters to be delivered to Court
Prepare factual summary for all First Day pleadings for R. Zahralddin
Prepare proffer of Meakin testimony for R. Zahralddin

Prepare argument for TRO Motion argument for First Day Hearing for S.
Kinsella '

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding preparation of TRQ Mation
Argument for 8. Kinsella in advance of First Day Hearing

Analyze record (2.4); instructions and case strategy meetings to and with K.

Harmon and S. Kinsella re: preparation of summaries for evidentiary record

(1.2): analyze summaries and prepare argument autine (2.3); instructions to
K. Harmen re: same (.5); analzye K. Harmon draft and finalize presentation

proffer/evidentiary record (1.2)

Preparation of first day hearing binders for U.S. Trustee, chambers,
co-counsel and R. Zahralddin
) |

Page 6

1.10 Hrs
1.00 Hrs

0.30 Hrs
5.10 Hrs

2.10 Hrs

3.20 Hrs

2,90 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

8.30 Hrs

15.30
Hrs

.80 Hrs
0.50 Hrs
3.30 Hrs
1.20 Hrs
G.20 Hrs
040 Hrs
.80 Hrs
0.50 Hrs
3.10 Hrs

2.20 Hrs
2.10 Hrs

0,30 Hrs

7.60 Hrs

7.20 Hrs
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

01/20/16

01/2018

01/20/16

01/2018

01/20/16
01/20/16

01/21/16
01/21/16
01/21/16

01721186

01/21/16
11216

012116

01/2116

01/21/16

o1/21/16

012116

0112416

01/21/16

01421116
012516

01/26/18

01/2716
0142716
01727116

01728116

SIC

SIC

SAK

SAK

SAK
SAK

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH
KHH

KHH

RXZ

SiC

SIC

SIC

SAK

SAK

SAK
SIC

SIC

EMS
SIC
SAK

EMS

Various comespondence with FT1 regarding first day hearing agenda and
related documents

Preparation of notice party list; correspondence with S. Bissell and K.
Harmon regarding same

Review filed first day pleadings and communications with S. Roberts re
same

Communications with R. Zahralddin re Court's scheduling of First Day
Hearing and preparations for the same; instructions to staff

Communications with US Trustee re upcoming hearing

Instructions fo K. Harmon re argument preparation; review materials re
sarme: prepare for First Day Hearing

Prepare for First Day Hearing
Attend First Day Hearing

Conference with R. Zahralddin, S. Kinsella and 5. Roberts regarding
outcome of First Day Hearing and tasks to be completed in implementing
judge's rulings

Revisions to Notice to be sent to all interested parfies and posted on
Monitor's website to comply with judge’s rulings at First Day Hearing

Email revised Notice to Courl for judge to So Order

Email to Monitor with documents to be sent to interested parties as decided
by judge during First Day Hearing

Revisions to email being sent to 5. Bissell with infermation and descriptions
to be included on Monitor's website

Prepare for hearing (4.0); attend hearing (1.3); follow up and supervision of
service and work with the Court re: docketing of orders and answering
inquires from Court staff (2.3)

Circulate filed orders to professionals for review and record

Preparation of first day motion summary per S. Bissell request; circulate
summary and first day pleadings to S. Bissell for upload to website

Conference with R, Zahralddin, 8. Kinsella and K. Hammon regarding first
day hearing

Prepare for hearing and instructions to K. Harmon re same (.9); attend
chapter 15 first day hearings {1.3); post hearing conference with R.
Zahralddin, S. Roberts and K. Harmon re next steps {.5)

Communications with R. Zahralddin re sale issues and instructions re same
Review docketed Orders

Preparation of record regarding Canadian proceeding decuments and
related correspondence regarding same

Correspondence with R. Zahralddin regarding objection deadlines;
preparation of summary to L. Rodgers; circulate same

Analyze comments to opinion lefter
Preparation of agenda for February 4, 2016 hearing

Instructions to §. Roberts re preparing Certificate of No Objection for
Emergency Motion if no objections filed on 02/01/16 and preparations for
hearing on 02/04/16 re same

Call with A_ Levene re; opinion letter
Page 7

0.20 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

D.50 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
1.40 Hrs

340 Hrs

1.60 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

7.60 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

2.10 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

270Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.40 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
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FT! Consulting Canada, Inc.

01/28/16 EMS  Finallze opinion lefter

01/28M6 KHH  Analysis of comespendence from client to ensure fe service of relevant
documents has been made as required by Court

01/28M18 MCG  Final revisions to Primus Opinion Latter

01128116 SIC Follow up with S. Bissell regarding service of orders; conference with S.
Kinsella and K. Harmon regarding sams

01/29/16 . EMS  Office conference with K. Harmon re: (gl (.2); research re: I
(7}

01/29/16 KHH Coordinate service of documents on Purchaser in response to Purchaser's
counsel's assertion that he was never served

01129116 KHH Conference with R. Zahralddin and S. Kinsella regarding Motion for Approval
of Sale and related Motion to Shorten Time dus on February 1st

01/28116 KHH Draft Motion for Approval of Sale on behalf of client

01/29/16 MCG  Obtain list of DE Chapter 15 cases, review docket and obtain key pleadings,
create and organize files for each case as basis for research on Primus case
in DE

01/29/46 RXZ  Discuss SN //h Canadian counsel for
the Monitor and related emails {.6}; and related follow up and instructions
with K, Harmen and 8. Kinsella re: same (1.5)

01/20/16  SIiC Instruction from R. Zahralddin and K Harmon regarding service of
documents 1o B. O'Neill; preparation of same

04729116 SAK Instructions to K. Hammon re sale motion and motion fo shorten preparations;
communications with R, Zahralddin re same

01/29M6  SAK Related follow up and Instructions with K. Harmon and from R. Zahralddin
re: sale motion

o1/28/16 SAK Instructions to K. Harmon re preparation of sale motion and potential motion
to expedite

01/30/18 EMS  Emails with R. Zahralddin re: IS

01/30/16 KHH  Draft 2 of Motion for Recognition of Sale o track language to which UST
pointed out in Essar Steel pleading and to incorporate citations to Canadian
Orders and APA

01/30/16 KHH Email draft Motion for Recognition of Sale to counsel for Moniter and
counsel for Debtors

01/30/16 RXZ Analyze first draft of motion to approve sale and related updates io same
(1.2}, call to K. Harmon re; same {.4}

01/30/16 RXZ Analyze further updates from Canadian counsel including Birch APA

01/30/16 SAK  Confirmn s znalyze orders, rules, and previous precedent and
practice before Judge Silverstein and discuss with R. Zahralddin

01/30/16 SAK  Analyze draft of sale motion and communications with R. Zahralddin re
same

013016 SAK  Multiple communications with co-counsel and Monitor's counsel re sl
I

TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES
LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY

Page B

3.90 Hrs

0.2G Hrs

0.90 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

490 Hrs

1.70 Hrs

2.10 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

1.50 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

420 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

1.60 Hrs

1,20 Hrs
2.10 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

196

$106,032.50




FT! Consulting Canada, Inc,

Barane, Alice C. 5.80 Hrs 175 fhr
Brown, Ashiey J. 0.40 Hrs 200 /hr
Gregory, Mark C, 22.90 Hrs 225 fhr
Raberts, Sandra | 5B.0C Hrs 225 fhr
Hatmon, Kathryn Hodges 58.00 Hrs 300 fhr
STEMERMAN, JONATHAN M. 3.40 Hrs 375 fnr
KINSELLA, SHELLEY A. " 44,80 Hrs 450 /hr
SUTTY, ERIC M. 4590 Hrs 450 /hr
SIEDZIKOWSKI, HENRY F. 3.60 Hrs 480 /hr
Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X. 41,90 Hrs 610 /hr
284.50 Hrs

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

TELEPHONE

01/01/15 THE CONFERENCE GRGUP, LLC-—-INV#181 - JAN 2018

DTD 01/01/16 DE CONFERENCE CALL FEES FOR THE

PERIOD: 12/01/15-12/31115

COMPUTERIZED LEGAL RESEARCH

01/28/16 LEXISNEXIS (BB/HA/PHAYB/SC/DE)---INV #3080397457
DTD 12/31/15: LEGAL RESEARCH FOR THE PERIOL:

DEC 01, 2015 - DEC 31, 2015

DOCKETS

01/25/16 PACER SERVICE CENTER (DE)—INV #10/01/15-12/31/156
DTD 01/07/16: DOCKET RETRIEVAL FOR THE PERIOD:

10/01/16-12f31/15

$980.00
$80.00
$5,152.50
$13,050.00
$17,400.00
$1,275.00
$20,160.00
$20,655.00
$1,728.00
$25,659.00

$106,039.50

32.42

17.93

127.90

Total Reimbursement for out of pocket expensas

Page 9

197

$32.42

$17.93

$127.90
$178.25




198

FTi Caonsulting Canada, Inc.

TOTAL THIS BILL - $108,217.75

GRAND TOTAL DUE $106,217.75

Amounts outstanding over 30 days are subject fo 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected.

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at (215) 977-1014

Page 10
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|[ Elliott Greenleaf| |

www.clliottgreenleaf.com 1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700
Wilmington, Delaware 19801

Phone: (302) 384-9400 « Fax: (302) 384-9399

A Professional Corporation

March 11, 2016

VIA ELECTRONIC AND FIRST CLASS MAIL
At Nigel Meakin

FIT Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O.Box 104

Toronto, ON M5K 1G8, Canada

nigel. meakin@fticonsulting.com
steven,bissell@fticonsulting.com

Re: Primus Telecommunicafions Canada Ine., Primus Telecommunications,
Tne,, and Lingo, Inc,
Qur File No, 60612-001
Invoice No.: 133488

Dear Nigel:

Fnclosed is our statement for legal services rendered in the above-referenced matter through
February 29, 2016 in the amount of $75,719.91.

.Paymcnt can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed below:

CHECK: WIRE:

Elliott Greenleaf, PC. Royal Bank America ;
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, 732 Montgomery Ave. 5
P.0. Box 3019, Natberth, PA 19072 :
Blue Bell, PA 19422-1956. ABA# 031 901 097

Tlliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowski, P.C. E
Acct. # 1000689990 '

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(302) 384-9401 or at rxza@elliottgreenleaf.com.

Sincerel

fael X. Zahralddin

RXZA: ach

Enclosure

cc:  Debbie Dougherty
Patricia Rooney
Steven Bissell
Linc Rogers

WILMINGTON BLUER BELL PHILADELPHIA SCRANTON WILKES-BARRE




Elliott Greenleaf

www.clliottgreenicaf.com

Aftn: Nigel Meakin

FTI Consulfing Canada, Ine,

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.0. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189 .

March 11, 2016

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.C. Box 104
Toranke Ontario M5K 1G8

CANADA

FOR PRCOFESSIGNAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Ine., and Lingo, [nc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through February 29, 2018

02f01/18

02/01/18
02/01/16

02/01/16

p2/01/16

02/01/18

02/01/16
02/01116
02101116

02/0116

02/01/16
0201716

AJB

KHH
KHH

KHH

KHH

RXZ

SIC
SIC
SIC

SIC

SAK
SAK

Circulate conference call information to participants re! _
]

Draft fMotion to Shorten Natice related to Sale Recognition Motion 7

Revisions to draft Motion to Shorten Notice related fo Sale Recognition
Motion

Emall to Birch's counsel with draft Motion for Sale Recognition per Canadian
counsel's request

Phone calls with V. Calina regarding information required for Motian for Sale
Recognition

Instruction to S. Reberts regarding preparation of record of documents from
client

Preparation of cetiificate of no objection regarding TRQ motion
Preparation of affidavit of service regarding entered orders; filing of same

Preparation of agenda for February 4, 2016 hearing; prepare hearing
binders for same

Instruction fram R. Zahralddin regarding preparation of record of documents
from client

Instructions to K. Harmen re emergency motion to shorten

Review and edit Motion to Shorten; conference with K. Harmon re revisions
to same

Page 1

Bii] Mumber 133488
File Nurnbar 60612-001

.20 Hrs

2.80 Hrs
1.50 Hrs

010 Hrs

.40 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
0.70 Hrs

010G Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.50 Hrs




FTI Consulting Canada, [nc.

02/02/16

02/02/16

02/02f16

02102/16

02102118

02/02/16

02/02/16
02102116

02/02116

02/02116

02/02/16

02/02/18

02/02116

0202116
02/02/16
02102116

02/02/16

02/03/16

02/03/16

02/03{16

02(G3/16

02/03/18

02/03/16

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

MCG

MCG
RXZ

RXZ

RXZ

sIc

SAK

SAK

SAK
SAK
SAK

SAK

KHH

KHH

RXZ

RAZ

RXZ

RXZ

Conference call with N. Meakin, L. Rogers, A. Shalvari, R, Zahralddin and S.
Kinsella regarding

Conference with 8. Kinsella and R, Zahralddin regarding edits to be made to
Sale Recognition Motion based upon conference call with client regarding
same

Call to N. Meakin regarding TG
]

Call to A. Shalvari regarding JEEEEEE
IR

Edits to Sale Recognition Motion and Motion to Sharlen to incorporate those
provided by Canadian counsel, counsel to the Debtors and counsel o the
Purchaser and draft Orders for both Motions

File Agenda, serve Agenda, File Cerlificate of No Objection

Prepare and file notice of agenda and certification of counsel

Call with the client and Canadian counsel re: IINIEININGEGENEGENGEGENNNNS
I

Updates on various motions and related meetings and review of draits and
related record re: saies, assumption, and related relief including procedureal
mofions

Emails to and from legal team and Moniter re: I

I (1.7 }; related updates (.5); and preparatlon and
supervision of fling and servlce {(.8)

Filing of Agenda for February 4, 2016 hearing; circulate same

Revise and finalize Notice of Agenda for 02/04/16 hearing; finalize
Certificate of Service re same; review Hearing Binder for Court submission;
instructions to M. Gregory re filing/service/submission of same

Multiple communications with paralegals and co-counsel re preparations for
upcoming hearing

Teleconference with professionals regarding S
Review sale recognition mofion with K. Harmon and instructions re same

Revise Certificate of No Objection re request for provisional relief extension;
instructions to 5. Reberts re filing and service

Multiple communications with co-counsel and stafi re service issues;
instructions to M. Gregory and K. Harmaon re same

Call with S. Bissell regarding serving of documents filed in chapter 15

proceeding i

Edits tc Motion to Shorten and Limit Motice and Motion for Sale Recognition
and related Orders o incorporate comments from Canadian cocunsel and the
United States Trustee

Update motion to shorten and limit notice {5); instructions o K. Harmon (.4)

Calls to and from A. Pincus re: [NGNINGNGGG
I

Analyze updated comments to PT Holdco 7 Order to Shorten from A, Shalviri
{.2); instructions to K. Harmon {.1)

Instructions to K. Harmon re: circulation to UST of motion to shorten and
sale recognition order (.2); emalils fo and from UST (.3}; follow up with K.
Harmon {2}, analyze UST comments (.3)

Page 2

0.70 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

11.30
Hrs

1.10 Hrs
1.10 Hrs
0.80 Hrs

5.00 Hrs

3.00 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.70 Hrs
1.30 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

(.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

7.1Q Hrs

0,90 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

1,00 Hrs

201




FT1 Consulting Canada, Inc.

02/03/16

02/03116
02/03/16
02/03/16

02/a3M6

02/03/16

02/03/16
02/03/16

02/0316

02/03A16

02/03/16

02/04/16
02/04/16

02/0416

02/04/16

02/04/16

02/04/16

02/04/16

02/04/16

02/04/16
02/04/16

02/04/18

02/05/16

RXZ

RXZ
RXZ
sIC

SIC
SIC

SIc
sic

SIG
SAK
SAK

RXZ
RXZ

RXZ
5IC
5IC

SIC
Sic

SAK

SAK
SAK

SAK

KHH

Emagil from 5. Bissell re: PT Holdeo motion to sharten and follow up with K.
Harmon

Analzye Osler Affidavit
Analyze motion record of sale transaction and assignment of agreements

Preparation of telephonic appearance for S. Bissell and N. Meakin;
correspondence regarding same

Preparation of Notice of Metian to Shorten and Notice regarding Motion for
Sale

Preparation of exhibits to Motion to Shorten and Motion for Sale per K.
Hammon request

Preparation of Amended Agenda

Preparation of Affidavit of Service regarding Agenda and certificate of no
ohjection

Correspandence with K. Harmon regarding filing of Motion to Shorten;
preparation of same for filing; file same

Analyze comments from US Trustee re sale recognition mation and motion
to shorten

Communications and conferences with K. Harmon re revisions to Sale
Recognition Motion and Mation to Shorten; review drafts re same

Attend hearing and related follow up with Court

Prepare and Emaif hearing report to client and co-counsel (.2), retated
replies {.1)

Prepare far hearing
Preparation of edits to amended agends; filing; effectuate service of same

Preparation of proposed order for provisional relief and edits regarding
same; filing; effectuate service of same :

Preparation of affidavit of service regarding amended agenda and
certification of counsel; filing of same

Preparation of ceriification of counsel regarding proposed order for
provisional refief and edits regarding same; filing; effectuate service of same

Draft Certification of Counsel, revised Second Provisional Order; Amended
Agenda, revised First Provisional Order for blackline purposes, conference
with R. Zahralddin re revised Order; telephone conference with Gourt re
revised Order and related upcoming hearing issties; Instructions to S.
Roberis re revisions to pleadings and creating blackline of Orders; review
Certification of Counsel, revised Second Order and blackiine Order,
Amended Notice of Agenda, Cerlificate of Service and finalize all for filing
and service; review hearing binder for Court submissions, supervise filing
and setrvice of same; instructions to §. Roberts fo inform Court of updated
filings and binder delivery

Communications with US Trustee re upcoming hearing and related issues

Prepare for upcoming hearing and conference session with R. Zahralddin re
same; attend hearing

Review Second Provision Order entered on docket and instructions to S,
Roberts re same

Incorporate additional edits from Blakes into draft Sale Recogniticn Motian

Page 3

0.10 Hrs

0.80 Hrs
2.20 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

C0.20 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.20 Hrs

0.30Hrs

0.20Hrs

1.50 Hrs

0.80 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

(.40 Hrs
0.60 Hrs
210 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

3.20 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.70 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

1.10 Hrs
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

02/05/16

02f05M18
0210516

02/05/16
02/08H16

02/08/16

02/08/16
02/08/18

02/08/16

02/08/16

02/0916
02/08M16

02/09/16

02/09/16

02/05/16

0210916

02/08M16

02/09/16

02/08118

02/09116

02/09/16

02/09{16

02/08/16

KHH

RXZ
RXZ

SAK
RXZ

RXZ

Sic
sIC

SAK

SAK

EMS
KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

RXZ

sIc

SIC

sic

SIC

Emall updated version of Draft Sale Recognition Motion fo client and counsel
for the Debtors for review and comment.2

Fallow up on noticing issues with paralegals

Analyze updated draft of the Sale Recognition Motion {.8); and relatad
instructions to K. Harmon (.3); analzye comments to motion and order (.6)

Review draft motion for sale recognitian

Analyze Blakes sale recognition order comments (.4); and relaied
communications with K. Harmon (.4}

Analyze blackiine of S. Kinsella's comments to the Sale Recognition Qrder
{.3); related updates (.2); and related record {.2)

Preparation of edits and blackline to sale recognition order per S. Kinsella

Various correspandence with R. Zahralddin, S. Kinsella, K. Harmon and
outside counsel regarding edits to sale recognition order; circulate same

Communications with K. Harmon re incorporation of multiple edits into
proposed Sale Recognition Order; instructions fo S. Roberts re preparation
of blacklines: revise Qrder; instructions to S. Roberts re distribufion and
further edits

Review notice of change of Canadian Proceeding hearing dates and
communpications re same

Analyze setved parties and office conference with K. Harmon re: same

Edits to Sale Recognition Motion and Order based upon comments from
Stikemans

Analysis of propar notice parties for Sale Recognition Motion based upon
Information provided by FT1 and Stikemans

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding Certification of Counsel and
pbtaining new hearing date for Sale Recognition Motion

Email to FTI, Blakes and Stikemans with additional edits to Sale
Recognition Order and Motion for review before sending to Purchaser's
counsel

Email to Blakes and FTI regarding NN |

Call with J. Silverstein's deputy regarding obtaining new hearing date for
Sale Recognition Motion and Court's availability for same

Draft Certification of Counset to be filed In support of seeking new hearing
date for Sale Recognition Motion

Calls to the Court, discussions with L. Johnson {1.2); updates to K. Harmon
and related instructions {.5); follow up with client and co-counset {.4);
instructions to K. Harmon and draft outline for certification{.4); order (.3); and
related updates and follow up (.4)

Preparation of summary to R, Zzhralddin and K. Harmon regarding service
of sale recagnition documents; circulate same

Preparation of spreadsheet regarding sale recognition motion service
procedures and list of parties; circulate to K. Harmon for review and
comment; preparation of K. Harmon edits to same

Various correspondence with S. Bissell regarding service parfies and notice
procedures; updates to spreadsheet regarding same

Circulate certification of counsel to K. Harmon for reference

Page 4

0.20Hrs

0.50 Hrs
1.70 Hrs

0.70 Hrs
0,80 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

2.50 Hrs
0.60 Hrs

2.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.30 Hrs
0.60 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

3.20Hrs

1,10 Hrs

280 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

02108116

(2/08/16

02/09/16

0211016

02/10/16

0211018
211018

02M10M186

02/10/16

02/10/16

0210186

02/10/16

0211016

0210416

02/10/16

02110/186

0211116

02111/16

02111186

02111416

02/11/16

021116

SIC

8AK

SAK

KHH

KHH

KHH
KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

SIC

SIC

SIC

sIC

SIG

5AK

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

Preparation of proposed order regarding hearing date; circulate to K.
Harmen

Communications with professionals re N

Review draft Cerification of Counsel re hearing date and email comments
from K. Harmon re same

Emails with FT[ regarding S it
I

Email 1o FT|, Blakes and Stikemans with service chart requested by Blakes
for input and sign off by all before sending to Purchaser's counsel

Read email from A. Shalvari regarding [ IENGTGTNGNGNGNGNE

Ermail draft Sale Recognition Mation papers te Purchaser's counsei for
review and input in advance of filing tomerrow

Call with S. Bissell, K. Hamadi and S. Roberts regarding service parties for
Sale Recognition Motion papers and which firm will be responsible for what
service

Call to J. Silverstein's deputy to secure hearing date for February 29th on
Sale Recognition Motion papers

Review and analysis of draft service list to ensure all required parties and
information are included therein

Conference call with S. Bissell and K. Harmon regarding service lists and
notice procedures

Comespondence with R. Zahralddin regarding objection and certificate of no
objection deadlines regarding petition for recognition; update record
regarding same

Circulzte docket entries (o K. Hamidi per request

Preparation of updates and finalize service and nofice procedures chart;
circulate fo K. Harmon for review

Various correspondence with S. Bissell and K. Hamidi regarding service
parties

Communications with Monitor and professicnals re IR
|

Incorporate final edits and comments from Blakes and FTl into Sale
Recegnition Motion and Sale Recognition Order in advance of filing same
today

Incorporate edits fo Certification of Counsed regarding Order on Mation to
Shorten and Limit Nofice of Sale Recognition Mofion

Email to Purchaser's counsel again requesting comments and revisions in
advance of filing today and read response

Erniails to and from Biakes regarding filing ]
I

Call to Court advising that Sale Recognition Metion had been filed and call
from Court advising that Order granting Motion to Shorten and Limif has
been signed and entered

Call from FT1 with question regarding IR
|

Page §

0.40 Hrs

(.30 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

1.0 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

1.80 Hrs

1.70 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
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FT! Constiting Canada, Inc.

02r11/16

02/11/18
02/11/16
02111/16
02111116

02/11116

o2111/16

oz2M1116

02111118

02111186

0211416

02/11/16

02/1218
021218

0212116

02126

0H12/16
0212116
02112/16

o22/16

02H2M16

f2/121r1e

02/12/16

KHH

RXZ
SIC
SIC
SIC

sIc

e

SAK

SAK

SAK

SAK

SAK

KHH
KHH

KHH

RXZ

3IC

SIC

8IC

SIC

SAK

SAK

SAK

Email to Blakes, FTI and Stikemans with documerts filed today and
confirming that service is being handled by EG and FT1 on respective
assigned parties

Analyze Service List for Sale Recognition Motion and related emails
Circulate senvice list in excel format to S. Bissell for conversion
Update senvice list regarding BroadSoft inc. address

Preparation of Sale Recognition Motion, exhibits, and certificate of service
regarding same for filing; filing and service of same

Preparation of certification of counsel regarding motion to shorten; exhibits,
and certificate of service regarding same for filing; filing and service of same

Analyze Notices of Appearance filed for Universal Service Admin Co.;
circulate to attorneys for review; update record regarding sarme

Communlcations with co-counse! re Broadsoft service issue

Draft Certification of Counsel re Motion to Shorten and Limit Notice re Sale
Recognition Motion; finalize for {iling; instructions to S. Roberts re filing and
service of same

Review and revise Motion for Recognition of Sale Mation, Notice and
proposed form of Order; review multiple Exhibits; finalize all for fliing;
instructions to 8. Roberts re filing and service; supervise same

Analyze Order entered granting Motion to Shorten and instructions to S.
Roberts re same

Review fited Notice of Appearance filed on behalf of Universal Service
Administrative Company and Instructions to S. Roberts re same

Read email from R. Zahralddin with instructions

Confer with 8. Kinsella about instructions regarding -G
I

Analysis foliow-up with R. Zahralddin and 8. Kinselia and related
recommendation to R. Zshralddin

Emait from N. Meakin and instructions and

N 2); follow up with S.Kinsella and K. Harmon and finalize related
recommendation ta client {,5); calls to UST re: waiver (.5); prepare and
deliver recommendation to client {.4)

Filing of Monitor's Report; circulate to attorneys for record

Ressarch regarcing (N

Preparation of affidavit of service regarding sale motion and order granting
motion to shorten; circulate to K. Harmon for review; filing; circulate filed
copy of same

Inform atiorneys regarding upcoming agenda and cbjection deadlines;
update record regarding same

Email from R. Zahralddin with instructions {,2}; confer with K. Harmon and
instructions regarding NG (.5 follow up
with R, Zahralddin and K. Harmen and related recommendation to R.
Zahralddin {.5)

Instrucfions from R. Zahralddin and related voice mail message from party
interested in telecom assets (.2); related faliow up (.2)

Analyze First Report of the Moniter dated February 9, 2016

Page 6

0.20 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
2.10 Hrs

1.90 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

1.80 Hrs

2.90 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

.20 Hrs
Q.50 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

1.60 Hrs

0.20Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

1.20 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

Q.20 Hrs
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

0211216

02/16116
02116116

02116418
02H6M8

02,1616
021616
021618

02/16/16

02/17/16
02117116
0217116
02117116
02118116
02118116
02/18/18

02/18/16

gz118/16
Qz/18/16

02/18/16

02/18/18

SAK

KHH
KHH

RXZ

RXZ

RXZ
Sic
SIC

SAK

AJB

RXZ
RXZ
SAK
AJB

KHH
RXZ

RXZ

RXZ
RXZ

sic

SAK

Research re I | ¢ munications with K,

Harmon and R. Zahralddin re same

Read email from A. Shalvari regarding R

Read emails from A. Shalvari and M. Cameron regarding I
I

Updates from co-counsel, debtors counsel and client (.4); and related
meetings with 5. Kinsella and K. Harmon {.4); re: sale and related license
updates

Emails to and from N. Meakin re: [N (-2); analyze and update CNO and
agenda and forward to 5. Kinsella forfmallzation {. 2) instructions fo S.
Roberts re! filing and service (.3)

Analize emalls from Canadian counsel re; INGEGGGGEGEGGEG_GR

Preparation of Certificate of No Objection regarding Petition for Recognition;
circulate to K. Harmen for review and approval

Preparation of Agenda for February 19, 20116 hearing; preparation of 5.
Kinsella edits o same

Communications with co-counsel re SIININGNGGEGEEGEGEGEEEN <vise
Certificate of No Objection re motion; finalize revised Cerfificate of No
Chjection and instructions fo S. Roberts and K. Harmaon re filing and service
of same; review and revise Natice of Agenda re upcoming hearing; finalize
Agenda and Certificate of Service; instructions re filing/service; review
hearing binder for Court submission

Prepare record and circulate chambers contact information ta extend
hearing

Emails and related investigation re; USAC (.4); calls and emails to 5.
Kinsella and instructions re: same (.2)

Update and approve summary from S. Kinsella for client re: N

Telephone conference with counsel for USAC re sale issues {.4); research
re (. =nd prepare detailed communication for Monitor
and professionals re same (.8}

Circulate conference call instructions to participants

Conference with S. Kinsella regarding I

Conference call on informal response (5); prepare for same (.2)

Call with S. Kinsella re: sale timing issues and due process in US filings {.5);
analzye updates via emait from K. Harmon artd S. Kinselia in file re: sale
schedule (.4)

Prepare for hearing

Updates to and from the Court regarding hearing {.3); and related
instructions to 8. Kinsella and 5, Roberts (.4}; follow up updates fram both

{.3)

Instruction from R. Zahralddin regarding February 18, 2016 hearing
preparation; correspondence with chambers regarding same, follow up with
R. Zahralddin

Telephene conference with Monitar and professionals re IGETGEGG__—_—_—_—
(.3); telephone conference with counsel for USAC {.4)
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1,70 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.30 Hre

0.80 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

(.60 Hrs

Q.30 Hrs

1.20 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

.20 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.60 Hrs
1.00 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

070 Hrs
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02HEMG
0218116

0211916
02/19/16
02/19/16

0211915
02/19/16

0219116

0211916

02/19116

02118186
02118116

02/19/16

02{18/16
02/19186
02/18/16

02/20/ 1 6
02121116
02/21116
Q2/21116
02722716

022216
02220186

02/22/16

SAK

KHH

KHH

RXZ

SIC
SIC

SIC

SIC

SIC

SAK
SAK

SAK

SAK
SAK
SAK

RXZ

SAK

KHH

RAZ

SAK

Communications with Monitor and professicnals re NEFEGEG_———
[ =nd related issues (4); instructions to S. Roberts re obtaining later
Bankruptcy Court date and foltow up (.2)

Read emails regarding rescheduling of hearing and comments from UST
regarding Sale Recognition Motion and ensure service of Notice of
Rescheduled Hearing on Sale Recognition

Read response from caunse! to USAC regarding potential objection

Attend hearing (.8); follow up and compliance with local rules on service
issues and supervise same (.7); follow up hearing report and emait fo
co-counsel and client {.3)

Carmnmunications with client and coeunsel for USAC re: claim and sale order
issues

Preparation of CourtCall appearance for N. Meakin

Instruction from S. Kinsella regarding Meakin Declaration exhibit and related
hearing preparation

Correspondence with S. Kinsella regarding adjournment of hearing;
preparation of notice of adjournment; flling; effectuate service of same

Conference with S. Kinsella regarding preparation of blackiine regarding sale
recognition order; preparation of same; circulate to Trustee for review and
reference

Caorrespondence with chambers regarding adjournment of sale recegnition
hearing

Prepare for upcoming hearing; attend hearing

Instructions to S. Roberts re preparing additional blackline of Sale Order
pursuant to UST's requests; review and communications re same

Instructions to S. Roberts re preparation of re-notice of Sale Recognition
Order; review Notice and Certificate of Service, finalize

Communications with T. Fox re upcoming hearing
Analyze Order entered on Bankruptcy Court docket granting Recognition

Communications with counsel for USAC re sale issues, email exchanges
with co-counsel re same

Emails to and from Canadian co-counse! re: |G (3)
follow up with USAGC counsel {.4)

Ana1yzehMonitor's second report {.2); and forward instructions to K. Harmaon
(-2)

Emails from USAC counsel with list of issues to address, forward same (.1);
and analyze same {.3)

Analyze USAC counsel's communications and conference with R.
Zahralddin re same

Email to G, O'Neill, counsel to USAC, regarding amended proposed order in
Canadian proceeding and to set up teleconference to discuss USAC's
concerns

Emails and calls re: USAC issue

Analyze R. Nice Affidavit {.3); emails re: objections and refated withdrawal
attached to record in Canada {.4}; approval and vesting order (.7); and Stay
Extension and Distribution Order (.6)

Communications with K. Harmon re USAC issues
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0.60 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.16 Hrs
1.80 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
0.80 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

1.40 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

010 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.60 Hrs
2.00 Hrs

0.20 Hrs
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02/23M6

02/23/16

02/2316
02/23M16

02/23/16

02/23/16
0272316

02/23M16

D2/23/16

0212316
02/23/18

02/23/16

02/23/16
02/23/16

02/23/16
02123116

02724118
02/24/16
02/24/16
02/24116
02124116
02/24/16

02/24186
0225116

02/25/16

ACB

ACB

ACB

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH
RXZ

RXZ

RXZ

SAK

SAK
SAK

KHH
KHH
KHH
sIC
SIC
SIC

SIC
RXZ

SIC

Preparation of record re: affidavit of service for filing (.1); file (.1); effectuate
service re: same (.1}

Preparation of record re: Notice of filing of Revised Proposed Order and
Notice re: Hearing on Sale Recognition (.2); file {.2); effectuate service re:
same (.2}

File Second Report of the Monitor dated Feb. 19, 2016 (.1}, effectuate
service re: same {.3}

Conference with R. Zahralddin, M. Gregory and S. Roberis regarding
documients that need to be filed today

Draft Notice of Hearing on Sale Recognition Motion with all related deadlines
and relevant background pursuant to local rules and practices and make
revisions thereto

Draft Notice regarding filing of amended sale-related Canadian Orders as
required by local rules and practices and make revisions thereto

Analysis of documents to be filed today to ensure all are produceable and
they do not contain any privileged information or irrelevant documents

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding Notice to be filed related to
rescheduling of Sale Recagnition Hearing and required information to be
contained therein

Email to counsel for USAC with documents filed today to ensure notice as
required

Email to ET) with documents filed today to ensura notice as required

Prepare for call {4); attend call with client, Canadian co-counset and USAC
caunsel (.9)

Multiple meetings and related updates of noticing issues and compliance
with Court's orders on same (2.3); supervise filing and service of orders,
nofices, and Monitors report (2.5)

Emails to and from USAC counsel re: objection deadline extension

Confirm extended objection deadline for USAC; and communications re
resclution of same

Analyze Notice of Canadian and US Sale / Sale Recognition hearings

Analyze filed Notice of Service of revised Distribution and Vesting Orders;
review same

Emails with FT1 regarding

Call from K. Hamidi re:

Read email regarding _

Preparation of certificate of no objection regarding sale recognition motion
Preparation of agenda for March 4, 2016 hearing

Preparation of affidavit of service and service list regarding nefices and
second monitor's report

Circulate docket items to FTI for upload to website

Calls and emaiis to counsel for USAC to confirm informal objection
withidrawal (.5); emails and retated instructions re: service and related record
for Court {4)

Preparation of edits to Affidavit of Service per K. Harmon comment; filing,
ciroulate to FTI for upload to website
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0.30 Hrs

0.60 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

(.30 Hrs

1.80 Hrs

1.50 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
1.30 Hrs

4.80 Hrs

(.20 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
0.4C Hrs

0.30 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
0.30 Hrs
0.30 Hrs
.60 Hrs

.10 Hrs
.90 Hrs

0.40 Hrs
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02/25M6 SIC Preparaticn of edits to Agenda per K. Harmon comment 0.20 Hrs
02/26M16 ACB Prepare and effectuate service re: Certification of Counsel 0.30 Hrs
02/26/16 RXZ  Analyze entered Primus Approval and Vesting Order and related record (.7}, 120 Hrs
related communications with USAC counsel (.5)
02/26M6 RXZ  Calls to the Court re: hearing and objection status (.5); instructions to S. 3.20Hrs
Roberts re: certification of counsel {.5); analyze same and update (.4};
finalize same (.3); supervise filing and service of same (.5)
0z2/26/16  SIC Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding certification of counsel; preparation ~ 2.90 Hrs
of edits to same per R. Zahralddin comment; follow up regarding same;
filing; effectuate service of same
02/26116 SAK Communications with co-counsel and USAC counsel re potential objection 0.20 Hrs
02/29M16 XS Meeting with S. Kinsella re: sale recognition hearing 0.10 Hrs
02/29116  KHH Email o Core Notice Parties with Second Amended Motion package filed in 040 Hrs
CCAA proceeding today and to be filed tomorrow in chapter 15 proceeding
in advance of Sale Recognition Hearing on March 4 in Delaware
02/29/16 RXZ  Analyze Second Supplemental Motion Record (1.2); insfructions to K. 1.70 Hrs
Harmon re; agenda, filing, service and related follow up with USAC and Core
Group (.5)
pz/29116  SIC Conference with R. Zahralddin and K. Harmon regarding March 4, 2016 0.40 Hrs
hearing agenda; preparation of R, Zahralddin comments to same
TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES
LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY
Barone, Alice C. 1.60 Hrs 175 Ibr $280.00
Brown, Ashley J. 0.40 Hrs 200/hr $80.00
Gregory, Mark C, 2.20 Hrs 225 /hr $495.00
Rcberts, Sandra | 32.70 Hrs 225 /hr $7,357.50
Harmon, Kathryn Hodges 43.50 Hrs 300 /hr $13,050.00
STEMERMAN, JONATHAN M. 0.10 Hrs 375 /hr $37.50
KINSELLA, SHELLEY A 31.90 Hrs 450 fhr $14,355.00
SUTTY, ERIC M. 0.30 Hrs 450 fhr $135.00
Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X. 51.00 Hrs 610 /hr $31,110.00
163.70 Hrs $66,900.00
Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses
TELEPHONE
02/0118 THE CONFERENCE GROUP, LLC—-INV#182 - FEB 2016 2.98
DTD 02/01/18 DE CONFERENCE CALL FEES FOR THE
PERIOD: 01/01/16-01/31/16

DELIVERY—COURIER SERVICE
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01/26/16

01/26/16

02/03/16

0210316

02/05/16

02/22{16

0272416

02/29/18

02/29/16

RELIABLE WILMINGTON—-INV #WL058991 DTD 01/26/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAND DELIVERY SERVICE
ON 01/26/16

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-—-INV #WL080G17 DTD 01/26/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAND DELIVERY
SERVICES TO JUDGE SILVERSTEIN ON 01/26/16 SIR

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— [NV #6-576-65722 DTD
02/03/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY TO ALEXIS
LEVINE TORONTO, ON CANADA ON 01/28/16

RELIABLE WILMINGTON—-INV #WL060215 DTD 02/03/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY SERVICE
TO JUDGE SILVERSTEIN ON 02/03/16

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-—INV #WI.060297 DTD 02/05/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAND DELIVERY SERVICE
TO JUDGE SILVERSTEIN

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-~INV #WL060658 DTD 02/22/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAND DELIVERY SERVICE
ON 02/22(16

RELIABLE WILMING TON—-INV #WL060728 DTD 02/24/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY SERVICE -
TRUSTEE ON 02/24/16 ACB

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-—iNV #WL060791 DTD 02/28/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAN DELIVERY SERVICE -
DELIVERY BINDER TO US BANKRUPTCY COURT SIR

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-—INV #WL060803 DTD 02/28/18
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAND DELIVERY SERVICES
TO JUDGE SILVERSTEIN AND US TRUSTEE ON 02/29/16
SIR

QUTSIDE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

0222116

FILING FEES

01/21/16

01721116

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)---INV
#02/22/16 DTD 02/22/16 PERIOD: COVERED:
01/25f16-02/22/168 COURT CALL LLC—INV#7418577 DTD
02/12/16 COURT TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE
APPEARANCE FEE ON 02/12/16 W/ STEVEN BISSELL
RXZ

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)--INV #
01/21/16 DTD 01/21/18 PERIOD COVERED:
12/22/15-01/21/16 COURTS/USBC - DE FILING FEE ON
01/20/16 RXZ

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)-—INV #
01/21/16 DTD 01/21/16 PERIOD COVERED:
12/22/15-01/21/16 DELAWARE OF CORP - FILING FEE
RE: ENTITY DETAILS ON 01/08/16 EMS

COMPUTERIZED LEGAL RESEARCH
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22.50

7.50

76.07

7.50

7.50

15.00

7.50

7.60

16.00

%166.07

30.00

$30.00

8,585.00

20.00

$8,605.00
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02/25/16 LEXISNEXIS (BB/HA/PHNVB/SC/DE)—INV #3090424826 15.86
DTD 01/31/16: LEGAL RESEARCH FOR THE PERIOD:
JAN 01, 2016 - JAN 31, 2018

$15.86
Total Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses $8,819.91
TOTAL THIS BILL $75,719.91
GRAND TOTAL DUE $75,719.91

Amounts outstanding over 30 days are subject to 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected,

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at (215) §77-1014

Page 12
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Elliott Greenleaf

www.clliottgreenleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.O. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-261718%

Attn: Nigel Meakin April 1, 2016
FTI Consulting Canada, Inc. Bill Number 133627
TD VWaterhouse Tower )
79 Wellington 5%., Sulte 2010 Fite Number 80612-001
P.O. Box 104 ’
Toronto Ontario M5K 1G8
CANADA

FOR PROFESSICNAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,

Inc,, and Lingo, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through March 31, 2016

03/01/16 ACB Preparation of record re: Notice of Filing of Record Related to Foreign 0.50 Hrs

Representative's Motion (.1); prepare and effectuate service re: same (.4)
03/01/16 EMS Analyze IEENEENGEGNGGGNGGNENERNNNE - d related emails 3.20 Hrs
03/01/116  JXS Analyze email from R. Zahralddin re: sale recognition hearing 0.10 Hrs

03/01/168  JXS Meeting with R. Zahralddin re: sale recognition hearing; analyze emails fram  0.40 Hrs
Foreign Representative and Lender re! same

03/01/16  JXS Analyze second supplemental affidavits re: sale to Birch 0.30 Hrs

¢3/0116  KHH Prepare Notice of Filing of Second Supplemental Motion Record and make 1.80 Hrs
revisions thereto

03/01/16  KHH Conference with 8. Kinsella regarding agenda for March 4th hearing 0.30 Hrs
03/01/16  KHH Revisions to agenda for March 4th hearing 1.30 Hrs

03/01/16 MCG  Meeting with SAK, RXZA and KHH re: drafting and filing of agenda review 1.60 Hrs
- and supplement agenda call clerk and trustee fo determine preferences
regarding binder prepare binder

03/01/16 SAK Communications with paralegals and aftorneys re preparation of Agenda for ~ 1.80 Hrs
upcoming hearing on Sale Recognition Motion; review preliminary draft
Agenda and docket; substantiafly revise and instruct K. Harmon and M.
Gregory re revisions and preparation of corresponding hearing binder for the
Bankruptcy Court and United States Trustee

03/02/16  JXS Instructions to M. Gregory re: sale recognition hearing 0.10 Hrs

03/02/16  JXS Frepare for sale recognition hearing; meetings with S. Kinsella and R. 2.70 Hrs
Zahralddin re: same; telephone call with L. Rogers re: same
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03/02/16
03/02/16
03/02/16
03/02/16

03/02/16
03/02/16
03/02/16
03/02/16

03/02/16
03/02/16

03/02/16

03/02/16
03/03/16
03/03/186
03/04/18

03/04/16

03/04/16

03/04/16

03/04/16
03/04/16

03/04116

KHH
KHH
MCG
RXZ

sic
sic
sic
sIC

Sic
sIC

SIC

SAK
JRS
RXZ
AJB

JXS

MCG

RXZ

SIC
SiC

SIC

Finalize Agenda for March 4th hearing on Sale Recognition Motion
Call to A. Shalvari regarding Endorsement from Canadian Proceeding
Prepare binder for agenda

Emails re: hearing requests and coordinate with paralegals (.5) finalize
agenda {.3) and reports and emails from M.Gregory re: requests from
Chambers {.5) finalize notice of fling entered assignment order(.2) analyze
assignment order (.2) and related emalls to and from Canadian counsel (.3}

Conference with M. Gregory regarding preparation of Agenda and hearing
binder for March 4, 2016 hearing

Preparation of telephonic appearances of N. Meakin, L. Rogers, N,
MacParland and 8. Kinsella for March 4, 2016 hearing

Preparation of Notice of Filing of Assignment Order; filing; effectuate service
of same

Preparation of agenda for March 4, 2018 hearing; filing; effectuate service of
same

Correspondence with K. Hamidi regarding service of agenda and netice

Preparation of Affidavit of Service regarding Natice of Filing of Assignment
Order and Agenda; filing; effectuate service of same

Preparation of Affidavit of Service regarding certification of counsel
regarding the Sale Recognition Motion and the Notice of Filing the Motion for
Recognizing and Enfarcing the Assignment, Vesting and Distribution Orders;
filing; effectuate service of same

GConference with J. Stemerman in preparation of upcoming hearing on Sale
Recognition Hearing and submission of revised proposed form of Order with
all four exhibits attached

Prepare for sale recognition hearing

Emails to and from Canadian co-coursel re: INNENJEER (.4) follow up
with paralegals (.4)

Prepare record for hearing agenda and COC, circulate new hearing fime
(.1Y; file and prepare service for sale recognition order (.5)

Prepare for sale recognition hearing; telephone calls with and emails from/to
R. Zahralddin re: same; pariticpate at sale recognition hearing; emails
fromfto N. Meakin and R. Zahralddin re; @i i
AR telephone calls with R. Zahralddin and N. Meakin re: same;
supplement sale recognition order re: same; various meetings and emails
with Judge's chambers re: same; prepare certification of counsel re: sale
recognition order; analyze entered order recognizing sale; email to R.
Zahraiddin and N. Meakin re: same

Prepare binder for JMS and clean copy of order and exhibits for court
execution

Prepare for hearing (1.2) attend hearing (.6) related follow up and
discussions with J. Stemerman (.8) paralegals (.7} client and J. Stemerman

(-5
Preparation of certification of counsel regarding sale recognition order;
preparation of exhibits to same; filing; effectuate electronic service of same

Correspondence with A. Brown regarding service of certification of counsel
regarding sale recognition order

Correspondence with M. Gregory regarding hearing preparation and Sale
Recogniltion Order and related exhibits

Page 2

0.10 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
1.10 Hrs
2.70 Hrs

(.30 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

0.90 Hrs

0.90 Hrs

0.10 Hrs
0.50 Hrs

0.0 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

0.80 Hrs

0.60Hrs

5.80 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

3.60 Hrs

0.90 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.80Hrs
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03/04/16
03/04/16
03/07/16
03/07/16
03/07/18
03/0718

03/09/16
03/09/16

03/10/16

03/10/16
03/10/16

03/10/18

03/10M18

03/10/M16
03/10/16
03/10/16

03/1116

03/12/16

03/12/16

03/14/16

03/14/16

03/14116

03/14/16

03/14/18

03114/16

03/15/16

03/15/16

SIC
SAK
KHH
SIC
Sic
SIC

RXZ
SIC

KHH

KHH
KHH

KHH

KHH

RXZ
RXZ
SIC

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

KHH

RXZ

RXZ

SIC

KHH

KHH

Correspondence with L. Rogers regarding [N

Multiple communications with co-counsel re Sl

Receipt and analysis of Request for Notice filed by party in interest
Correspondence with K. Hamidi regarding service of sale recognition order
Effectuate service of sale recognitior order on core notice parties

Circulate Request for Notfices to K. Hamidi to updéte record; update EG
records regarding same

Analyze correspondence from USAC counsel

File affidavit of service regarding Sale Recognition Order, circulate to S.
Bissell for website

Call from D. Merrett at Jones Day regarding concems Purchaser has related
to service

Conference with S. Kinsella regarding call from D. Merretl at Jones Day

Email to D. Merrett at Jones Day with Procedures Motion and Order in
response to his cal!

Email to Monitor and L. Rogers with T
[ ]

Conference with R. Zahralddin regarding inguiry from D. Merrett at Jones
Day and proposed response thereto

Analyze (.
Analyze Proof of Claim and call to claimant re: same

Instruction from K. Harman regarding Birch counsel draft review research;
research| follow up correspondence with K. Harmon

Draft response to Jones Day's inquiry related to notice issues in chapter 15
proceedings

Read emails related to response to be sent to Jones Day regarding their
inquiry on potential notice issues In the chapter 15 proceedings

Send email to Jones Day in response ta inquiry related to patential notice
issues in chapter 15 proceeding

Read emails from Purchaser's US counsel, the Monitor and Blakes
regarding

Conference with R, Zahralddin and S. Reberts regarding service done in
case in evaluating inquiry from Purchaser's US counsel

Draft response to Purchaser's counsel's inquiry related to service and
incorporate edits provided by Monitor and Blakes

Calls and emails re: notice issues (.5) analzye filed documents and record
(.6) calts and emails with K. Harmen (.3) and A. Shalviri (.3)

Further review of /N

instruction from R. Zahralddin regarding affidavits of service (.1); conference
with R. Zahralddin and K. Harmon regarding same (.2); update record (1)
follow up regarding amended affidavit of service (.9)

Analysis of Notice Crder and Motion in light of inquiry regarding nolice
issues from Jones Day

Conference with R, Zahralddin regarding notice issues raised by Jones Day
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0.20 Hrs
0.40 Hrs
0.10 Hrs
0.20 Hrs
0.80 Hrs
0.30 Hrs

’ 0.70 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.1C Hrs

0.10 Hrs
0.20 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.50 Hrs
0,40 Hrs
0.90 Hrs

0.40 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.50 Hrs

1.70 Hrs

0.70 Hrs

1.30 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.10Hrs
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215

03/15/16  KHH Conference with R. Zahralddin and L. Rogers regarding I 0.30Hrs
I
03/1e/18 RXZ Emails to and from N. Harold re: retainer (.2) follow up with client and debtor ~ 0.70 Hrs
(.3} instructions to A. Brown re: same (.2)
03/21116  JXS . Emails from/to R. Zahralddin re: Sprint proof of claim 0.10 Hrs
03/21/16 RXZ Emails from S. Kinselta on proof of claim hy Sprint (.1); coordinate response 1,10 Hrs
and instructions to J. Stemerman and paralegals re: same (.3); anafyze
report and related record (.3); follow up with unsecured creditor {.4)
03/21/16 SAK  Analyze proof of claim filed by Sprint and forward emails (.3}; to R. 0.50 Hrs
Zahralddin re; same (.2}
03/22/16  JXS Analyze Sprint proof of claim 0.40 Hrs
03/22/116 RXZ Connect N. Harold with B, Nice re: retainer return 0.40 Hrs
03/23/16  SBAK Docket searches and searches on Judge's calendar for updates to case 1.10 Hrs
status (.8) report to R. Zahralddin {.3)
03/246 RXZ  Analzye record and related review of docket reports from week 1,20 Hrs
TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES $21,862.50
LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY
Barone, Alice C. 0.50 Hrs 175 fir $87.50
Brown, Ashley J. 0.60 Hrs 200 /hr $120.00
Gregory, Mark C. 3.90 Hrs 225 /hr $877.50
Roberts, Sandra | 9,70 Hrs 225 fhr $2,182.50
Harmon, Kathryn Hodges 740 Hrs 300 /hr $2,220.00
STEMERMAN, JONATHAN M, 11.20 Hrs 375/hr $4,200.00
KINSELLA, SHELLEY A. 4.20 Hrs 450 /hr $1,890.00
SUTTY, ERIC M. 3.20 Hrs 450 thr $1,440.00
Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X. 1450 Hrs 610/hr $8,845.00
T 5520 Hrs m
Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses
TELEPHONE
03/01/16 THE CONFERENCE GROUP, LLC---INV#183 - MAR 2016 22.87
DTD 03/01/16 DE CONFERENCE CALL FEES FOR THE
PERIOD: 02/01/16-02/26/16
$22.87
COFYING
03/02/16 Copying 11.25
03/04/16 Copying 14.75
$26.00
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DELIVERY--COURIER SERVICE

03/01/18

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/18

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/18

03/01/16

03/01/16

03/01/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)— INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/18 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE WILMINGTON, DE

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-097-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
OFFICE DELAWARE SECRETARY OF STATE DOVER,
DE ON 02/11/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-- INV #5-987-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY TO
PRES/GENERAL MANAGER FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 02/11/18 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-097-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 02/11/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-897-23846 DTD
03/01/168 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US
ATTORNEY'S OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 02/11/16
RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE BALTIMORE, MD ON 02/17/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE DOVER, DE ON 02/18/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 02/19/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-997-236456 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US
ATTORNEY OFFICE WILMINGTON,DC ON 02/19/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE OF TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 02/19/16 RXZ

. FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)— INV #5-997-23846 DTD

03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY TO US
ATTORNEY DISTRICT OF DE WILMINGTON, DE ON
02/19/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)— INV #5-997-23848 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, BG
ON 02/23/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-—- INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US
ATTORNEY OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 02/23/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE - SECRETARY OF STATE
DOVER, DE ON 02/23/16 RXZ
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc,

03/0116

03/01/16

03/02/18

03/03/16

03/03/16

03/07/16

03/08/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE OF TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 02/23/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE}-—- INV #5-997-23846 DTD
03/01/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE INSOLVENCY DEPT BALTIMORE,
MD ON 02/23/16 RXZ

REL!IABLE WILMINGTON---INV #WL060865 DTD 03/02/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY TO JUDGE
SHANNON 03/02/1¢& SIR

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-—iNV #WL060892 DTD 03/03/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY TC JUDGE
SILVERSTEIN ON 03/03/18 SIR

RELIABLE WILMINGTON---INV #WL080807 DTD 03/03/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY TO
TRUSTEE ON 03/03/16 SIR

RELIABLE WHLMINGTON-—-INV #WL060942 DTD 03/07/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY TO US
TRUSTEE ON 03/07/16 SIR

RELIABLE WILMINGTON---iNV #WL060975 DTD 03/08/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE

10.08

13.19

15.00

7.50

7.50

7.50

7.50

Total Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

TOTAL THIS BILL

PREVIOUS BILLS CUTSTANDING

03/11/16 75,719.91

$75,719.91

GRAND TOTAL DUE

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at {215} 877-1014

Page 6

Amounts outstanding over 30 days are subject to 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received affer prior posting may not be reflected.
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$269.89

$22,132.39

$97,852.30
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| | Elliott Grécnleaf ‘I

www.clliottgreenleaf,com 1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700
A Professional Corporation Wilmington, Delaware 19801

Phone: (302) 384-9400 + Fax: (302) 384-9399
June 16, 2016

VIAELECTRONIC AND FIRST CLASS MAIL
Attn: Nigel Meakin : : '

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O.Box 104

Toronto, ON MK 1G8, Canada
nigel.meakin@fticonsulting.com
steven.bissell@fticonsulting.com

Re:  Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc,
Our File No. 60612-0601
Inyoice No.: 134957

Dear Nigel:

Enclosed is our statement for legal services rendered in the above-referenced matter through
May 31, 2016 in the amount of $2,170.02.

Payment can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed below:

CHECK: WIRE:

Elliott Greenleaf, PC. Royal Bank America
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, - 732 Montgomery Ave.
P.O. Box 3010, Narberth, PA 19072
Blue Bell, PA 19422-1956. ABA# 031 901 097

Elliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowski, P.C.
Acct. # 1000689990

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(302) 384-9401 or at rxza@elliottgreenleaf.com.

Sincerely,

ef X Zahralddin

RXZA: ach
Enclosure
cc:  Debbie Dougherty
Patricia Rooney
Steven Bissell
_Linc Rogers

" WILMINGTON BLUE BELL PHILADELPHIA SCRANTON WILKES-BARRE




[Elliott Greenleaf

www.elliottgreenleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.O. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189

Attn: Nigel Meakin . June 15, 2016

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc, Bill Number 134957

TD Waterhouse Tower

219

79 Wellingten St., Suite 2010 File Number 80612-001

P.0O. Box 104
Toronto Ontaric M5K 1G8
CANADA .

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Linge, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through May 31, 2016

03/22/16  SIC Preparation of record of claim of Sprint; circulate to J. Stemerman for review

0401116 RXZ Emails re: Monitor's Certificate from Blake's, analyze same, and forward
instructions to K. Harmon and paralegals

04/05/16 MGG  Prepare and file monitors certificate

04/05M6 RXZ Supervise filing and service of Monitor's Certificate Filed by FT] Consulting
Canada Inc. in its capacity as monitor of PT Holdco, Inc. by Nigel D. Meakin,
Senior Managing Director

04/05/16 RXZ  Instructions to S. Roberts re: PT Holdco Monitor’s Certificate [Docket No. 50]

04/08M16 SIC Correspondence with K. Harmon regarding Affidavit of Service; preparation
of same

04/11/16 SIC Update Affidavit of Service for K. Harmon review and signature; filing;
circulate to FTI for uplead to website

05/03/186 KHH  Email to creditor (L. Clark) with website information where pleadings can be
found and forward same correspondence to S. Bissell per his request

056/13/16  RXZ Ermails and related follow up re: Frontier receivable
05/16/16 RXZ  Galis to and from D. Brown re: funds for Primus Telecom
05/17/16 RXZ Emails to and from D. Brown and N. Meakin re: funds for Primus Telecom

TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES

Page 1

0.20 Hrs
0.40 Hrs

1.10 Hrs

0.20 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.30 Hrs

0.10 Hrs

0.50 Hrs
.30 Hrs
0.20 Hrs

$1,616.50




FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY

Gregory, Mark C. 1.10 Hrs 225 fhr

Roberts, Sandra | 0.80 Hrs 225 /hr

Harmon, Kathryn Hodges : 0.10 Hrs 300 /hr

Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X. 1.90 Hrs 610/hr
, 390 Hrs

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

TELEPHONE

04/01116

THE CONFERENCE GROUP, LLC —INV#184 - APR 2016

DTD 04/01/16 DE CONFERENCE CALL FEE FOR THE
PERIOD: 03/01/16-03/31/16

DELIVERY--COURIER SERVICE

02/12/16

04/05M16

04/05/16

04/05/16

04/05/16

04405116

04/05/16

04/05/16

RELIABLE WILMINGTON-—INV #WL060488 DTD 02/12/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES HAND DELIVERY TC JUDGE
SILVERSTEIN AND US TRUSTEE ON 02/12/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE}~- INV #5-374-44875 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 02/26/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-—- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US -
ATTORNEY'S OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 02/26/16
ON RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)}— INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY TO STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE DELAWARE SECRETARY OF
STATE DOVER, DE ON 02/26/16 RXZ

" FEDERAL EXPRESS (PE)-- INV #5-374-44975 DTD

(4/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE OF TREASURY DOVER, DE CN 02/26/16 ACB

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE BALTIMORE, MD ON 02/26/16 ACB

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)}— INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STARE OF TREASURY DOVER, BE ON 03/01/16 ACB

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-—- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE DELAWARE SECRETARY OF
STATE DOVER, DE ON 03/01/16 ACB

Page 2

$247.50
$180.00
$30.00
$1,159.00

$1,616.50

9.60

15,00

10.08

10.08

10.08

10.08

10.08

10.08

- 10.08

$59.50
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FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

04/05/16

04/06/16

04/05/16

04/05/16

" D4/0518B

04/05/16

04/05/16

D4/05/15

04/05/16

04/05/16

04/08/16

(4/05/16

04/05/16

04/05/16

04/05/M16

04/05/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 03/01/16 ACB

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-374-44875 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE BALTIMORE, MD ON 03/01/16 ACB

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERMNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 03/02/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)— INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US
ATTORNEYS OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 03/02/16
RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)~- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE DOVER, DE ON 03/02/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)~- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 03/02/18 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-—- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DEUVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE BALTIMORE, MD ON 03/02/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS {DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 03/04/16 SIR

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-—- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US
ATTORNEY OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 03/04/16 SIR

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE DOVER, DE ON 03/04/16 SIR

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-—- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE OF TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 03/04/16 SIR

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE BALTIOMORE, MD ON 03/04/16 SIR

FEDERAL EXPRESS {DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICES BALTIMORE, MD ON 03/07/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— [NV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE OF TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 03/07/16 RXZ

FiEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE STATE GOVERNMENT
OFFICE DOVER, DE ON 03/07/16 RXZ

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)— INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY U3
ATTORNEY OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 03/07/16 RXZ
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FTI Consulting Canads, Inc.

04/05/16

0411116

05/03/16

05/03/16

05/03/16

05/03/16

05/03/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-374-44975 DTD
04/05/18 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 03/07/16 RXZ

RELIABLE WILMINGTON---INV #WL061598 DTD 04/11/16
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE HAND DELIVERY SERVICE
TO US TRUSTEE ON 04/06/16 ACB

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-404-70188 DTD
05/03/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY FEDERAL
COMMUNICATIONS COMMISSION WASHINGTON, DC
ON 04/06/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-404-70188 DTD
05/03/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY US
ATTORNEY OFFICE WILMINGTON, DE ON 04/06/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)--- INV #5-404-70188 DTD
05/03/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY STATE
GOVERNMENT OFFICE DOVER, DE ON 04/06/16

FEDERAL EXPRESS (DE)-— INV #5-404-70188 DTD
05/03/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY DELAWARE
STATE OF TREASURY DOVER, DE ON 04/06/16

F EDERAL EXPRESS (DE)—- INV #5-404-70188 DTD
05/03/16 OVERNIGHT PACKAGE DELIVERY INTERNAL
REVENUE SERVICE BALTIMORE, MD ON 04/06/16

OUTSIDE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

03121116

03/21/16

03/21/16

0321186

DOCKETS

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)-—INV #
(3/21/16 DTD 03/21/16 PERIOD COVERED:
02/23{16-03/21/16 COURT CALL, LLC -—-INV# 7442308
DTD 02/24/16 COURT TELEPHONE CONFERENCE
APPEARANCE FEE ON 02/19/16 W/ NIGEL MEAKIN IN
ATTENDANCE

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)—INV #
03/21/16 DTD 03/21/16 PERIOD COVERED:
02/23/16-03/21/16 COURT CALL, LLC INV#7471693 DTD
03/10/16 COURT TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE
APPEARANCE FEE ON 03/04/16 W/ NIGEL MEAKIN IN
ATTENDANCE

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)---{NV #
03/21H16 DTD 03/21/16 PERIOD COVERELD:
02/23/16-03/21/16 COURT CALL, LLC INV#7471760 DTD
03/10/18 COURT TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE
APPEARANCE FEE ON 03/04/16 W/ NATASHA J.
MACPARLAND IN ATTENDANCE

BUSINESS CARD SERVICES (MASTERCARD)-—INV #
03/21/16 DTD 03/2%/16 PERIOD COVERED: -
02/23/16-03/21/16 COURT CALL, LLC - INVH#7472917 DTD
03/10/16 COURT TELEPHONIC CONFERENCE
APPEARANCE FEE CN 03/04/16 W/RXZ

Page 4

10.00

7.50

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

30.00

30.00

30.00

30.00

$314.02

$120.00




FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

04720116 - 'PACER SERVICE CENTER (DE)---INV #01/01/16-03/31/16 110.00
DTD 04/07/16: DOCKET RETRIEVAL FOR THE PERIOD:
01/01/16-03/31/18

Total Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

- TOTAL THIS BILL

GRAND TOTAL DUE

Arjﬂounts outstanding over 30 days are subject 1o 1 1/4% interest per menth.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected.

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at (215) 877-1014

Page 5

$2,170.02

223

$110.00
$553,52

__s2.17002




224

H Elliott Greenleaf |

www.elliottgreenleaf.com . 1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700
‘Wilmington, Delaware 19801

Phone: (302) 384-9400 » Fax: (302) 384-9399 :
July 15, 2016 :

A Professional Corporation

VIA ELECTRONIC AND FIRST CL.ASS MAIL
Attn: Nigel Meakin

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O.Box 104 o

Toronto, ON M5K 1G8, Canada

nigel. meakin@fticonsulting.com
steven,bissell@fticonsulting.com

Re:  Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc.
Our File No. 60612-001
Invoice No.: 135391

Dear Nigel:

- Enclosed is our statement for legal services rendered in the above-referenced matter through i
June 30, 2016 in the amount of $745.00, :

Payment can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed below:

CHECK: WIRE:

Elliott Greenleaf, PC. Royal Bank America
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, 732 Mentgomery Ave.
P.O. Box 3010, Narberih, PA 19072

Blue Bell, PA 19422-1956., ABA# 031 901 097
: Elliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowski, P.C.
Acct, # 1000689990

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me at .
(302) 384-9401 or at rxza@elliottgreenleat.com.

Sincerely,

RXZA: ach

Enclosure

ce:  Debbie Dougherty-
Patricia Rooney
Steven Bissell
Linc Rogers

WILMINGTON BLUE BELL PHILADELPHIA SCRANTON WILKES-BARRE




[[ElligEt Greenleaf ]

www.clliottgreenleaf.com

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.O. Box 3010
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189

Attn: Nige! Meakin

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.
TD VWaterhouse Tower

79 Wellingten St., Suite 2010
P.O. Box 104

Toronto Ontatrio M5K 1G8
CANADA

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Ine., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Lingo, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through June 30, 2016

08/01/16 RXZ Emails and call to and from FIS counsel re: proof of claim
08/0116  SIC Circulate proof of claim of FIS to attorneys for review

225

July 14, 2016
Bill Number 135391
File Number 806812-001

0.30 Hrs
0.10 Hrs

06/1316 RXZ Call with New Mexico taxing authorities re: proof of claim (.5); follow up with 0.70 Hrs

S. Roberts and client (.2}

06/14/16 SIC Analyze New Mexico taxation claims; summarize; circulate to professicnals 0.50 Hrs
for review; correspondence with R. Zahralddin regarding same; circulate

claim contact information for R. Zahralddin follow up

TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES $745.00

LLEGAL SERVICES SUMMARY

Roberts, Sandra | 0.80 Hrs 225 thr $135.00

Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X. 1.00 Hrs 610 /hr $610.00
T 160 Hrs T $745.00

Page 1




FT! Consulting Canada, Inc.

TOTAL THIS BILL

GRAND TOTAL DUE

Arhounts outstanding over 30 days are subject to 1 1/4% interest per month.
Payments received after prior posting may not be reflected.

For credit card payment, please contact
Patricia Rooney at (215) 877-1014

Page 2
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$745.00

$745.00
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Elliott Gr_c;e—nleaf |

www.elliotigreenleaf.com
A Professional Corporation

1105 North Market Street, Suite 1700
Wilmingron, Delaware 19801
Phone: (302) 384-9400 » Fax: (302) 384-9399
September 13, 2016 '

VIA ELECTRONIC AND FIRST CLASS MAIL
Attn: Nigel Meakin

FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington St.,-Suite 2010

P.0.Box 104

Toronto, ON M5SK 1G8, Canada
nigel.meakin@fticonsulting.com
steven.bissell@fticonsulting.com

Re:  Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Ine., and Lingo, Inc.
Our File No. 60612-001
Invoice No.: 136308

Dear Nigel;

Enclosed is our statement for legal services rendered in the above-referenced maiter through
August 31, 2016 in the amount of $1,561.50.

Payment can be sent via check or by wire transfer to the following addresses listed below:

CHECK: WIRE:

Elliott Greenleaf, PC, Royal Bank America
925 Harvest Drive, Suite 300, 732 Montgomery Ave.
P.O. Box 3010, - ‘Narberth, PA 19072

Blue Bell, PA 19422-1956 ABA# 031 901 097
' Elliott Greenleaf & Siedzikowski, P.C.
Acct, # 1000689990

Should you have any questions regarding this invoice, please do not hesitate to contact me at
(302) 384-940L or at n{za@elllottgreenleaf com.

Sincerely,

RXZA: ach

Enclosure

cc:  Debbie Dougherty
Patricia Rooney
Steven Bissell
Linc Rogers

WILMINGTON BLUE BELL PHILADELFHIA SCRANTON WILEES-BARRE




Elliott Greenleaf

www.clliottgreenleaf . com

Attn: Nigel Meakin :
FTI Consulting Canada, Inc.

TD Waterhouse Tower

ELLIOTT GREENLEAF
P.0. Box 3010 N
Blue Bell, Pennsylvania 19422
EIN #23-2617189

79 Wellington St., Suite 2010

P.O. Box 104

Toronto Ontaric MK 1G8

CANADA

FOR PROFESSIONAIL SERVICES RENDERED

September 13, 2016
Bill Number 136308

228

File Number 60612-001

Re: Primus Telecommunications Canada Inc., Primus Telecommunications,
Inc., and Linge, Inc.

LEGAL SERVICES

Through August 31, 2016

08/24/16 SAK Review Notice of Appearance filed by New York State Department of 0.20 Hrs
Taxation and Finance
08/26/16 RXZ Analyze spreadsheet and record of flled claims 0.40 Hrs
08/26/16  SIC Prepération of spreadsheet and record of filed claims; circulate to R. 1.30 Hrs
Zahralddin and K. Harmon
08/30/16 RXZ  Comespondence with A. Shalviri re; IS . D.20 Hrs
08/30M16  SAK Communications re case closure; review procedural requirements re same 1,80 Hrs
TOTAL LEGAL SERVICES
LEGAL SERVICES SUMN‘[ARY
Roberts, Sandra | ' 130 Hrs 225 fhr $292.50
Kinsella, Shelley A. 2,00 Hrs 450 fhr $900.00
Zahralddin-Aravena, Rafael X. 0.60 Hrs B10 /hr $366.00
T 380 Hrs T $1,668.50

Reimbursement for out of pocket expenses

DOCKETS

,' Page 1

$1,668.50

$1,558.50




FT1 Consulfing Canada, Inc.

p8M1M6

PACER SERVICE CENTER (DE)---INV #3394610-Q22016 3.00
DTD 07/05/16: DOCKET RETRIEVAL FOR THE PERIOD:
04/01/16 - D6/30/16

Total Reimbursement for out of packet expenses

! | TOTAL THIS BILL

GRAND TOTAL DUE

Armounts outstanding aver 30 days are subject fo 1 1/4% interest per month.

Payments received after prior posting may nat be reflected.

For credit card payment, piease contact
Patricia Rooney at (215) 877-1014

Page 2
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$3.00
$3.00

$1,561.50

$1,561.50




THIS IS EXHIBIT “B” TO
THE AFFIDAVIT OF RAFAEL X. ZAHRALDDIN-ARAVENA

SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 13™ DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2016

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits

(or as may be)

SANDRA ISABEL ROBERTS
NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE QF DELAWARE
My Commission Explres 02/25/2017
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EXHIBIT “B”
' ' Hourly Rate
- Name of Lawyer Year of Call
. _ ' 2015 2016
Rafael X, Zahralddin-Aravena, 2001 USD $610.00 | USD $610.00
Director and Shareholder
Shelley A. Kinsella; Managing 2001 USD $450.00 | USD $450.00
Shareholder of Delaware Office
Henry F. Siedzikowski; 1979 USD $480.00 | USD $480.00
Shareholder
Eric M. Sutty; Shareholder 2000 TUSD $450.00 | USD $450.00
Jonathan M. Stemerman; 2004 USD $375.00 | USD $375.00
Shareholder
Kathryn H. Harmon; 4ssociate 2009 USD $300.00 | USD $300.00
. Hourly Rate
Name of Support Staff Year of Call
T 2015 2016
Sandra I. Roberts N/A USD $225.00 | USD $225.00
Mark C. Gregory N/A USD $225.00 | USD $225.00
Ashley J. Brown N/A USD $200.00 | USD $200.00
Alice C. Barone N/A USD $175.00 | USD $175.00
Total Fees Billed: USD $273,212.00
Total Hours: 685.7
Average Hourly Rate: USD $398.00

22981298.1




232

‘ouy epeue)) Sunnsucy) [ 1. I0f sAsuIony

W00 Jea[Uas S HON[o)BZXd ([TeuI
66£6-78E-C0E  XB4
00¥6-¥8E-20€  -IPL

BUAARIY-UIPP[BIYEZ X [PEJey

10861 Sreme[a(] TCIFUIWII M
00L1 SNNS 9918 IHEN SOTT
AVATINTTED LLOTTTA

9107 ‘s] 12quaydag wiomg
VYNAAVIV
“NITATVIHYZ X TAVAVYH A0 LIAVULIAY

" 0JUOIO [, I8 pRouswio) Surpasnold

(LSI'T TYIDUANINOD)
ADLLSAC A0 TAN0D HOTIHANS
OIIV.INO

1'86Z1862T

T 19 "ONI ‘ODAI0H Ld 40 INAWADNVIIY 40 FSTNOYdNOD 40 NV'Id V 40 Y4 LLVIN HHL NI ANV
QHANANY SV 9¢-D 0 ‘$861 "D'S™Y LDV INFWITONVIYY SYOLIATYD SHINYIWNOD HHL 40 YHLLVIN HHL NI

0000-LSTIT-91-AD ON P[4 10D



TAB 3




Court File No. CV-16-11257-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

THE HONOURABLE ) FRIDAY, THE 16t

JUSTICE @ ) DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2016

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES” CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT,
R.5.C. 1985, ¢. C-36, AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT
OF PT HOLDCOQO, INC., PRIMUS TELECOMMUNICATIONS CANADA INC,, PTUS, INC,,
PRIMUS TELECOMMUNICATIONS, INC,, AND LINGO, INC.

Applicants

ORDER
(PASSING OF ACCOUNTS AND APPROVAL OF ACTIVITIES)

THIS MOTION, made by FII Consulting Canada Inc., in its capacity as Court-
appointed monitor of the Applicants (in such capacity, the “Monitor”) was heard this day at

330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario.

ON READING the Fourth Report of the Monitor dated September 14, 2016 (the “Fourth
Report of the Monitor”), the affidavit of Nigel Meakin, sworn September 14, 2016, the affidavit
of Linc Rogers sworn September 13, 2016 and the affidavit of Rafael Zahralddin-Aravena sworn
September 13, 2016, and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Applicants and counsel
for the Monitor, no one else appearing for any other person on the service list, although duly

served as appears from the affidavit of service of Agnes Kawalec sworn September 14, 2016,

22978512.3
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SERVICE

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and the
Motion Record in respect of this Motion is hereby abridged and validated so that this Motion is
properly returnable today and hereby dispenses with further service thereof.

DEFINED TERMS

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that unless otherwise defined herein, capitalized terms used in
this Order shall have the meaning given to them in the Stay Extension and Distribution Order of
Mr. Justice Hainey dated February 25, 2016, made in these proceedings (the “Stay Extension
and Distribution Order”).

APPROVAL OF FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that (i} the fees and disbursements of the Monitor for the
period from January 19, 2016 to August 31, 2016, inclusive, totaling CAD $1,033,484.61
(including applicable taxes), (ii) the fees and disbursements of the Monitor's Canadian counsel,
Blake, Cassels & Graydon LLP and local agents in New Brunswick, Manitoba and
Saskatchewan (collectively, the “Monitor’s Canadian Counsel”) for the period from April 27,
2015 to August 31, 2016, inclusive, totaling CAD $609,170.06 (including applicable taxes) and
(iti) the fees and disbursements of the Monitor's US counsel, Elliott Greenleaf LLP (the
“Monitor’s US Counsel”) for the period from December 9, 2615 to August 31, 2016, inclusive,
totaling 283,0440.59 (including applicable taxes), be and are hereby approved.

4, THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Monitor, the Monitor’s
Canadian Counsel and the Monitor's US Counsel to complete the Monitor’s remaining duties
and administration of these proceedings and the Chapter 15 recognition proceedings
(collectively, the “Subsequent Fees”) shall only be subject to approval by further or of this
Court, in the event that (i) the Subsequent Fees exceed an aggregate total of CDN $100,000
(excluding applicable taxes) with respect to the Monitor and the Monitor's Canadian Counsel

and USD $25,000 (including applicable taxes) with respect to the Monitor's US Counsel

229785123
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(collectively, the “Subsequent Fee Estimate”), and (ii) Bank of Montreal as administrative agent
for the lending syndicate requests that such approval be sought within three business days of
receiving written notice of the quantum by which the Subsequent Fees exceed the Subsequent

Fee Estimate,
APPROVAL OF ACTIVITIES AND POST-FILING CLAIMS PROCESS

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Third Report of the Monitor, dated July 13, 2016, and
the Fourth Report of the Monitor, and the actions, conduct and activities of the Monitor
described therein, including, without limitation, the Post-Filing Claims Process (as defined and
described in the Fourth Report of the Monitor) are hereby approved.

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Monitor is hereby authorized and directed to include
in the Holdback the amount of CDN $2.5 million in respect of Post-Filing Expenses claimed by
Bell Canada to be owing by the Primus Entities (the “Bell Holdback”). The Monitor is
authorized to disburse the Bell Holdback in accordance with the provisions of the Stay
Extension and Distribution Order on final determination of the Post-Filing Expenses owing to
Bell Canada, if any, whether by way of agreement between the Primus Entities, the Agent and
Bell Canada, or by further order of the Court (the “Bell Post-Filing Expenses”).

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that on payment of the Bell Post-Filing Expenses, if any,
by the Applicants or by the Monitor on behalf of the Applicants, the Monitor shall have no
obligation to cbntinue to maintain any Holdback for Post-Filing Expenses and no action lies
against the Monitor, its affiliates, agents, employees, officers or directors in connection with any

Post-Filing Expenses.
GENERAL

8. THIS COURT HEREBY REQUESTS the aid and recognition of any court, tribunal,
regulatory or administrative body having jurisdiction in Canada, the United States, or
elsewhere to give effect to this Order and to assist the Applicants, the Monitor and their

respective agents in carrying out the terms of this Order. All courts, tribunals, regulatory and

229785123
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administrative bodies are hereby respectfully requested to make such orders and to provide
such assistance to the Applicants and the Monitor, as an officer of this Court, as may be
necessary or desirable to give effect to this Order or to assist the Applicants, the Monitor and

their respective agents in carrying out the terms of this Order.
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